FIND YOUR DREAM
CAR WITH OUR
UNBERTABLE DEALS.

No need to bid.
First-come, first-served applies.

UNTIL JULY 10, 2026!

HOW TO BUY:

Choose your car from the attached list of cars for sale. Contact us to check the
availability of your preferred unit. Please find our contact details below.

m STEP2

Conduct own due diligence on the car you would like to purchase. As the Bank is
selling all units on an AS-IS-WHERE-IS basis, please check its physical and legal
condition before emailing us your intent to buy to carsforsale@rcbc.com.

Your intent to buy must contain the following:

a. Subject on the email should be INTENT TO BUY followed by the plate number
of your preferred unit. (e.g.: INTENT TO BUY NBS 2560)
b. For the body of the email, provide all the following details:
i. Plate number/conduction sticker
ii. Unit details: Year, brand, model, price (e.g.: 2020 Toyota Vios, P600,000)
iii. Buyer's name (Last Name, First Name, Middle Name)
iv. Contact numbers (mobile and landline)
V. Preferred mode of payment (cash or financing via RCBC Auto Loan)
vi. Address of residence
vii. Confirmation that you have inspected the unit physically at the warehouse
Confirmation that you have verified the unit's condition with the LTO
Confirmation that you have read and understood the list of requirements
for auto loan or cash payment

—BEER

The processing of offers (intent to buy) will be done on a first-come, first-served
basis. Please wait for an email within two (2) banking days from our sales officer on
the awarding of the unit.

PAY IN CASH OR APPLY FOR AN RCBC AUTO LOAN.
TERMS AND CONDITIONS APPLY.

REMINDERS:

. All units are sold on an AS-IS-WHERE-IS basis.

. Buyer must inspect the units listed in the List of RCBC Cars for Sale at the RCBC warehouses
and verify their condition with the Land Transportation Office prior to making a purchase. For
physical inspection of the cars, walk in directly to the warehouse anytime between 8:30AM and
5:30PM, from Monday to Sunday, except holidays. No need to set an appointment.

. The Bank reserves the right to pull out any unit from the list, as it deems necessary.

. Inadvertent misprints shall neither alter the unit's factual condition nor be
deemed as misinterpretation of the unit.

CONTACT US:
Monday to Friday, 9:00AM to 5:00PM only

For new inquiries: For follow-up on purchased units:

@ Mobile e Email e Landline

Jessica: 0998-868-1754 carsforsale@rcbc.com (02) 8894-9000
Jen: 0918-990-3805 Local # Gina: 7752 | Keith: 7757

Clyde (Vismin): 0968-259-0331 Cams: 7709 | Mich: 7576
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RCBC Cars For Sale - No Bid Required

June 22 to July 10, 2026!

Reminders in submitting your Letter Of Intent via email to carsforsale@rcbc.com: For inquiries, you may reach us thru the following
from Monday to Friday, 9:00AM to 5:00PM (exc. holidays):

Acceptance Date: Until 5:00PM of July 10, 2026 only. No extension of deadline.

Email:

Email Subject. “INTENT TO BUY (space) PLATE #” (e.g. INTENT TO BUY carsforsale@rche.com

ABC1234)

For new inquiries:
Jessica: 0998-868-1754 | Jen: 0918-990-3805
Clyde: 0968-258-0331 (VISMIN)

Your email must contain the following details:
i. Plate No. / Conduction Sticker No. indicated in the price list
ii. Unit Description: Year Model , Brand/Variant, Price

iii. Buyer’s Name (Last Name, First Name, Middle Name) For follow-up on purchased units:

iv. Contact Information (email, mobile & landline nos.) Trunkline: (02) 8894-9000

v. Mode of Payment (Cash or Financing via RCBC Auto Loan) Local Nos:

vi. Residential Address Gina: 7752 | Keith: 7757 | Cams: 7709 | Mich: 7576
vii. Confirmation that you have inspected the unit
viii. Confirmation that you have verified the unit's status with LTO & HPG Warehouse Schedule:

ix. Confirmation that you have read and understood the list of requirements for Monday to Sunday, 8:30AM to 5:00PM (exc. holidays)

No. Brand / Variant Transmission Plate # Mileage Color Warehouse Selling Price

PASIG WAREHOUSE

8516 A. Sandoval Avenue, Brgy. Pinagbuhatan, Pasig City
(Waze / Google Map: RCBC Auto Pasig Warehouse)

1| 2024 |Ford - Ranger AT DSL NKG 4596 4532 |  ABSOLUTE BLACK PASIG 1,337,000.00
2 | 2025 |Ford - Ranger ATDSL | DO 352A/NOA6724 4,557 | ALUMINUM METALLIC PASIG 1,561,000.00
3 | 2024 |GAC-GS8 2.0 GT AT SUV AT GAS NKG 2676 36,459 INK SEAL GREEN PASIG 1,324,000.00
4 | 2024 |GAC-M6 PRO 2024 GS MPV AT GAS NKU 3757 18,372 CRYSTAL WHITE PASIG 1,002,000.00
5 | 2020 |Honda-BRV AT GAS CAU 9016 27,731 PRE&"I'EL%XL’E:V(':BER PASIG 499,000.00
6 | 2025 |Honda-BRV AT GAS NHT 3782 7,378 METEA?EF;&B SRAY PASIG 908,000.00
7 | 2019 |Honda - City AT GAS NEH 5091 29,398 |  RUBY RED PEARL PASIG 498,000.00
8 | 2025 |Honda - City AT GAS NEN 6900 9,667 | PLATINUM WHITE PEARL PASIG 901,000.00
9 | 2025 |Honda - City AT GAS DBS5311 22,986 | PLATINUM WHITE PEARL PASIG 796,000.00
10 | 2018 |Hyundai- H100 MT DSL DAC 7845 129,031 CREAMY WHITE PASIG 312,000.00
1 | 2025 _rrigﬁggm-moo GL SHUTTLE MT DSL BAG 9320 21,225 WHITE PASIG 758,000.00
12 | 2025 |Hyundai - Stargazer 1.5 GL IVT AT GAS NEZ 6422 6,347 BLACK PASIG 920,000.00
13 | 2024 |ISUZU - TRAVIZ MT DSL NKE 2725 39,359 ARC WHITE PASIG 853,000.00
14 | 2024 |ISUZU - TRAVIZ MT DSL NKD 3316 59,122 ARC WHITE PASIG 858,000.00
15 | 2024 |ISUZU - TRAVIZ MT DSL DBR 1813 62,436 ARC WHITE PASIG 865,000.00
16 | 2024 |ISUZU - TRAVIZ MT DSL DBQ 3246 46,000 ARC WHITE PASIG 801,000.00
17 | 2025 |ISUZU - TRAVIZ MT DSL DCA 7327 16,987 ARC WHITE PASIG 895,000.00
18 | 2025 |ISUZU- TRAVIZ MT DSL NLA 5514 4,468 ARC WHITE PASIG 1,021,000.00
19 | 2026 |ISUZU- TRAVIZ MTDSL | DT 327B/NKU 1765 3,365 ARC WHITE PASIG 1,055,000.00
20 | 2026 |Isuzu - TRAVIZ MT DSL NKU 1525 1,718 ARC WHITE PASIG 1,060,000.00
21 | 2024 |IMC - JMH MT DSL NKG 3907 45,238 WHITE PASIG 742,000.00
22 | 2025 |KIA-K2500 2.5MTSC 2WD UTILITY MT DSL NKQ 8280 27,956 CLEAR WHITE PASIG 896,000.00
23 | 2025 |Kia-Sonet 1.5 LX AT SUV AT GAS ccQ 2453 2,866 WHITE PEARL PASIG 736,000.00
24 | 2021 |Mitsubishi - L300 FB MT DSL NEL 4546 90,862 POLAR WHITE PASIG 407,000.00
25 | 2022 |Mitsubishi - L300 FB MT DSL NFK 8730 94,361 POLAR WHITE PASIG 400,000.00
26 | 2024 |Mitsubishi - L300 FB MT DSL NKC 6910 27,079 POLAR WHITE PASIG 645,000.00
27 | 2024 |Mitsubishi - L300 FB MT DSL NKJ 7575 29,949 POLAR WHITE PASIG 612,000.00
28 | 2024 |Mitsubishi - L300 FB MT DSL NIT 1943 60,140 POLAR WHITE PASIG 602,000.00
29 | 2024 |Mitsubishi- L300 FB MT DSL NIT 8247 52,767 POLAR WHITE PASIG 578,000.00
30 | 2024 |Mitsubishi- L300 FB MT DSL NHH 8546 74,286 POLAR WHITE PASIG 629,000.00
31 | 2025 |Mitsubishi- L300 FB MT DSL NKG 7569 37,267 POLAR WHITE PASIG 679,000.00
32 | 2025 |Mitsubishi- L300 FB MT DSL NKS 1573 10,737 POLAR WHITE PASIG 817,000.00
33 | 2025 |Mitsubishi- L300 FB MT DSL NKQ 9650 11,359 POLAR WHITE PASIG 795,000.00
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Transmission Plate # Mileage Warehouse Selling Price

34 | 2025 |Mitsubishi- L300 FB MT DSL NKO 1543 38,315 POLAR WHITE PASIG 764,000.00
35 | 2025 |Mitsubishi- L300 FB MT DSL NEB 2629 38,009 POLAR WHITE PASIG 779,000.00
36 | 2025 |Mitsubishi- L300 FB MT DSL NJQ 3873 20,867 POLAR WHITE PASIG 759,000.00
37 | 2025 |Mitsubishi- L300 FB MT DSL NKM 3705 33,470 POLAR WHITE PASIG 667,000.00
38 | 2025 |Mitsubishi- L300 FB MT DSL NKH 4813 1,711 POLAR WHITE PASIG 662,000.00
39 | 2025 |Mitsubishi- L300 FB MT DSL NJC 3020 33,899 POLAR WHITE PASIG 675,000.00
40 | 2025 |Mitsubishi- L300 FB MT DSL NKT 2847 7,113 POLAR WHITE PASIG 722,000.00
41 | 2025 |Mitsubishi- L300 FB MT DSL NKK 4386 36,833 POLAR WHITE PASIG 688,000.00
42 | 2025 |Mitsubishi- L300 FB MT DSL NKS 5117 7,043 POLAR WHITE PASIG 779,000.00
43 | 2025 |Mitsubishi- L300 FB MT DSL NKM 5817 32,290 POLAR WHITE PASIG 650,000.00
44 | 2025 |Mitsubishi- L300 FB MT DSL NKQ 3835 22,062 POLAR WHITE PASIG 716,000.00
45 | 2025 |Mitsubishi- L300 FB MT DSL NKQ 3845 14,673 POLAR WHITE PASIG 742,000.00
46 | 2025 |Mitsubishi- L300 FB MT DSL NKK 9862 49,478 POLAR WHITE PASIG 675,000.00
47 | 2025 |Mitsubishi- L300 FB MT DSL NKN 4765 25,849 POLAR WHITE PASIG 734,000.00
48 | 2025 |Mitsubishi- L300 FB MT DSL NKN 6134 30,112 POLAR WHITE PASIG 714,000.00
49 | 2025 |Mitsubishi- L300 FB MT DSL NHL 7726 67,002 POLAR WHITE PASIG 666,000.00
50 | 2025 |Mitsubishi- L300 FB MT DSL NKO 9661 21,004 POLAR WHITE PASIG 726,000.00
51 | 2025 |Mitsubishi- L300 FB MT DSL NEZ 3132 40,737 POLAR WHITE PASIG 708,000.00
52 | 2025 |Mitsubishi- L300 FB MT DSL NKQ 8656 22,801 POLAR WHITE PASIG 624,000.00
53 | 2025 |Mitsubishi- L300 FB MT DSL DCA 8374 7,711 POLAR WHITE PASIG 754,000.00
54 | 2025 |Mitsubishi- L300 FB MT DSL DCC 6507 8,488 POLAR WHITE PASIG 755,000.00
55 | 2025 |Mitsubishi- L300 FB MT DSL NHU 3773 35,214 POLAR WHITE PASIG 622,000.00
56 | 2025 |Mitsubishi- L300 FB MT DSL CDA 5574 7,169 POLAR WHITE PASIG 771,000.00
57 | 2025 |Mitsubishi- L300 FB MT DSL DBT 6720 22,481 POLAR WHITE PASIG 712,000.00
58 | 2025 |Mitsubishi- L300 FB MT DSL DCA 5009 25,237 POLAR WHITE PASIG 760,000.00
59 | 2026 |Mitsubishi- L300 FB MT DSL NKU 2967 4,416 POLAR WHITE PASIG 815,000.00
60 | 2026 |Mitsubishi- L300 FB MT DSL NLC 3089 5,386 POLAR WHITE PASIG 806,000.00
61 | 2026 |Mitsubishi- L300 FB MT DSL NLA 6572 2,294 POLAR WHITE PASIG 832,000.00
62 | 2026 |Mitsubishi- L300 FB MT DSL NLA 6042 14,428 POLAR WHITE PASIG 809,000.00
63 | 2026 |Mitsubishi- L300 FB MT DSL NLB 9170 14,729 POLAR WHITE PASIG 810,000.00
64 | 2026 |Mitsubishi- L300 FB MT DSL NKU 3901 36,596 POLAR WHITE PASIG 787,000.00
65 | 2026 |Mitsubishi- L300 FB MT DSL NKU 3823 25,390 POLAR WHITE PASIG 843,000.00
66 | 2026 |Mitsubishi- L300 FB MT DSL NKT 9051 15,575 POLAR WHITE PASIG 813,000.00
67 | 2026 |Mitsubishi- L300 FB MT DSL NLC 8438 3,353 POLAR WHITE PASIG 803,000.00
68 | 2026 |Mitsubishi- L300 FB MTDSL | LX060B/NLC 1113 19,585 POLAR WHITE PASIG 797,000.00
69 | 2026 |Mitsubishi- L300 FB MT DSL NLA 9022 20,349 POLAR WHITE PASIG 801,000.00
70 | 2026 |Mitsubishi - L300 FB MT DSL NLC 1191 9,055 POLAR WHITE PASIG 802,000.00
71 | 2026 |Mitsubishi - L300 FB MTDSL  |UL 312A /NKU 2178 5,175 POLAR WHITE PASIG 820,000.00
72 | 2024 |MITSUBISHI MIRAGE G4 GLS AT GAS NEY 6421 47,138 | COOL SILVER METALLIC PASIG 503,000.00
73 | 2025 |MITSUBISHI MIRAGE G4 GLS AT GAS DBU 1666 13,071 RED METALLIC PASIG 599,000.00
74 | 2025 |MITSUBISHI MIRAGE G4 GLS AT GAS BAH 2935 23,638 T'TQ’\I‘E'%’A“{SCRAY PASIG 551,000.00
75 | 2021 |MITSUBISHI MIRAGE G4 GLX AT GAS CAW 1878 68,613 COOL SILVER PASIG 339,000.00
76 | 2023 |MITSUBISHI MIRAGE G4 GLX AT GAS DBH 3874 21,001 | COOL SILVER METALLIC PASIG 456,000.00
77 | 2024 |MITSUBISHI MIRAGE G4 GLX AT GAS VAB 8694 41,247 RED METALLIC PASIG 419,000.00
78 | 2024 |MITSUBISHI MIRAGE G4 GLX AT GAS EAJ 5200 36,607 T o SRAY PASIG 450,000.00
79 | 2025 |MITSUBISHI MIRAGE G4 GLX AT GAS DBS 3132 22,949 T o SRAY PASIG 559,000.00
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Warehouse

Selling Price

Manalac Avenue corner 1st Avenue, Bagumbayan, Taguig City

(Waze / Google Map: RCBC Auto Warehouse / Mang Inasal Commisary Taguig)

80 | 2025 |MITSUBISHI MIRAGE G4 GLX AT GAS NKS 5900 21,181 T'TQ’\I‘E'%’A“{LG'CRAY PASIG 542,000.00
81 | 2025 |MITSUBISHI MIRAGE G4 GLX AT GAS IAG 6239 20,268 T'TQ’\I‘E'%’A“{LG'CRAY PASIG 554,000.00
82 | 2025 |MITSUBISHI MIRAGE G4 GLX AT GAS EAL 1140 10,759 T'TQ’\I‘E'%’A“{LG'CRAY PASIG 566,000.00
83 | 2026 |MITSUBISHI MIRAGE G4 GLX AT GAS NKT 4654 12,005 RED METALLIC PASIG 658,000.00
84 | 2026 |MITSUBISHI MIRAGE G4 GLX AT GAS NKU 8768 7,434 T'TQ’\I‘E'%’A“{LG'CRAY PASIG 669,000.00
85 | 2026 |MITSUBISHI MIRAGE G4 GLX AT GAS BAH 6414 5,408 T'TQ’\I‘E'%’A“{LG'CRAY PASIG 686,000.00
86 | 2024 |MITSUBISHI-MIRAGE G4 GX 1.2L M MT GAS DBN 6938 7,483 T'TQ’\I‘E'%’A“{LG'CRAY PASIG 417,000.00
87 | 2025 |Mitsubishi - Montero Sport MT DSL DBP 6845 12,497 WHITE DIAMOND PASIG 1,101,000.00
88 | 2025 |Mitsubishi - Montero Sport ATDSL | LH 8638/ EAL 4499 8,638 JET BLACK MICA PASIG 1,512,000.00
89 | 2025 |Mitsubishi - Montero Sport AT DSL NHH 2779 18,735 JET BLACK MICA PASIG 1,427,000.00
90 | 2025 |MITSUBISHI-TRITON ATHLETE 4WD | AT DSL DCC 7311 10,137 JET BLACK MICA PASIG 1,576,000.00
91 | 2024 |MITSUBISHI-TRITON GLS 2WDATP| AT DSL DBS 9677 21,507 JET BLACK MICA PASIG 1,117,000.00
92 | 2025 |MITSUBISHI - XPANDER AT GAS NKU 7941 6,750 GRAPHITE GRAY PASIG 901,000.00
METALLIC
93 | 2025 |MITSUBISHI - XPANDER AT GAS NEY 6595 14,231 RED METALLIC PASIG 901,000.00
94 | 2025 |MITSUBISHI - XPANDER AT GAS NJK 7164 4132 GREEN BRONZE PASIG 892,000.00
METALLIC
95 | 2025 |MITSUBISHI - XPANDER AT GAS BAH 5814 12,683 | QUARTZ WHITE PEARL PASIG 893,000.00
96 | 2026 |MITSUBISHI - XPANDER AT GAS NJG 6976 8,414 GRAMPE%IEL?CRAY PASIG 1,028,000.00
97 | 2025 |MITSUBISHI-XPANDER CROSS 1.5 AT GAS NJQ 8501 2,418 GRE@'\}E&%\‘ZE PASIG 962,000.00
98 | 2025 |MITSUBISHI-XPANDER CROSS 1.5 AT GAS NKK 3318 28,699 QUAFafngLL%EEARL PASIG 894,000.00
99 | 2024 |MITSUBISHI-XPANDER CROSS 1.52| AT GAS NIU 1547 7,431 | QUARTZ WHITE PEARL PASIG 861,000.00
WITH 2-TONE
100 | 2025 |MITSUBISHI-XPANDER GLX 1.5G AT GAS NHT 1970 50,920 JET BLACK MICA PASIG 714,000.00
MITSUBISHI-XPANDER GLX 1.5G GRAPHITE GRAY
101| 2024 | M1 AT GAS NKD 4311 9,166 APHITE of PASIG 783,000.00
102 | 2025 |Nissan - Almera AT GAS DBU 8407 5,413 PEARL WHITE 2 PASIG 850,000.00
103 | 2025 |Nissan- NAVARA AT DSL CDA 4764 12,589 | STEALTH PEARL GRAY PASIG 1,338,000.00
104 | 2025 |Nissan- NAVARA AT DSL BAG 5363 57,485 | ASPEN PEARL WHITE PASIG 1,309,000.00
105| 2026 |Nissan- NAVARA AT DSL FE 6758 / NJJ 3199 12,845 GALAXY BLACK PASIG 1,337,000.00
106 | 2026 |Nissan- NAVARA AT DSL IAG 8134 3,377 | LUNAR METALLIC GRAY PASIG 1,337,000.00
107 | 2026 |Nissan - TERRA AT DSL CDA 4753 13,865 | STEALTH PEARL GRAY PASIG 1,735,000.00
108 | 2026 |NISSAN - TERRA 2.5L VE 4x2 AIT AT DSL FF198B / NJK 7727 3,970 GALAXY BLACK PASIG 1,628,000.00
109 | 2024 |NISSAN - TERRA 2.5L VL 4x2 AT AT DSL HAJ 2233 22,404 | ASPEN PEARL WHITE PASIG 1,765,000.00
110 | 2024 |Suzuki - DZIRE AT GAS NFM 3299 34,892 Blue PASIG 452,000.00
111 | 2024 |Suzuki- Ertiga MT GAS INV 1394 16,066 Black PASIG 600,000.00
12| 2025 |SUZUKI-XL7 AT GAS NKQ 5207 4,605 IVORY/BLACK PASIG 932,000.00
13| 2025 |SUZUKI-S-PRESSO GLAGS AT GAS BAH 3664 7,005 GRAY PASIG 502,000.00
HATCHBA
114 | 2025 |SUZUKI-S-PRESSO GLAGS AT GAS EAH 3410 26,854 WHITE PASIG 446,000.00
HATCHBA
115 | 2021 |Toyota - Hi-Lux 4x2 AT DSL NEP 3371 137,342 EMOTIONAL RED PASIG 842,000.00
116 | 2025 |Toyota - Hi-Lux 4x2 AT DSL NKP6130 23,073 SUPER WHITE Il PASIG 1,401,000.00
117 | 2024 |TOYOTA-INNOVA 2.8 XE DSL AT SU AT DSL DBP 2657 34,522 | BLACKISH RED MICA PASIG 938,000.00
118 | 2026 |TOYOTA- RAIZE 1.2 G CVT SUV AT GAS DCD1925 6,303 |  SILVER METALLIC 4 PASIG 777,000.00
119 | 2025 |Toyota - Rush AT GAS DBT 9180 9,604 |  BLACK METALLIC 1 PASIG 901,000.00
120 | 2023 |Toyota - Vios AT GAS DBI 4704 26,144 | ALUMINA JADE METALLIC PASIG 499,000.00
121| 2025 |Toyota - Vios AT GAS EAJ 4966 23,967 SUPER RED V PASIG 720,000.00
122 | 2026 |Toyota - Vios AT GAS NLA 2998 3,372 SUPER RED V PASIG 782,000.00
123 | 2026 |Toyota - Vios AT GAS NLD 5002 0,035 | GRAYISHBLUE MICA PASIG 780,000.00
METALLIC
BAGUMBAYAN (TAGUIG) WAREHOUSE

124

2023

Ford - Ranger

AT DSL CBT 8677 53,775 METEOR GRAY

BAGUMBAYAN

873,000.00
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125| 2024 |FORD-RANGER RAPTOR 2.0LBI4 | AT DSL BAG 4792 28,063 ARCTIC WHITE BAGUMBAYAN 1,932,000.00
126 | 2020 |Foton - Van Traveller MT DSL NGL 7687 ; White BAGUMBAYAN 399,000.00
127 | 2024 |GAC-GS32024 EMZOOM RSTYLE AT GAS NKL 7807 33,573 | MOONLIGHT GREY BAGUMBAYAN 682,000.00
128 | 2022 |GEELY - COOLRAY AT GAS CBE 9471 80,279 Silver BAGUMBAYAN 473,000.00
129 | 2023 |GEELY - COOLRAY AT GAS BAF 2087 33,643 White BAGUMBAYAN 554,000.00
130 | 2025 |Honda-BRV AT GAS BAH 6045 6,672 TAFFETA WHITE BAGUMBAYAN 975,000.00
131| 2023 |HYUNDAI - CRETA 1.5 GL IVT SUV AT GAS IAE 8838 9,774 RED BAGUMBAYAN 767,000.00
132 | 2024 |Hyundai - H100 MTDSL | K3 K675/ CCC 9479 8,575 White BAGUMBAYAN 844,000.00
133 | 2024 |Hyundai - H100 MT DSL CCF 4358 86,740 WHITE BAGUMBAYAN 770,000.00
134 | 2025 |Hyundai - H100 MT DSL CDA 1417 7,131 WHITE BAGUMBAYAN 806,000.00
135 | 2021 |HYLNDAIH100 2.5CRDIGL MT DSL BAE 7111 391,424 CREAMY WHITE BAGUMBAYAN 399,000.00
136 | 2025 |Hyundai - Stargazer 1.5 GL IVT AT GAS CCF 3317 14,966 SILVER BAGUMBAYAN 789,000.00
137 | 2024 |HYUNDAI - STARIA2.2 Premium+ 8 ATDSL | K3J495 / CCA 9203 16,185 WHITE BAGUMBAYAN 2,242,000.00
138 | 2024 |ISUZU - TRAVIZ MT DSL NHH 9666 27,305 ARC WHITE BAGUMBAYAN 941,000.00
139 | 2025 |ISUZU - TRAVIZ MT DSL NKM 7066 23,818 ARC WHITE BAGUMBAYAN 931,000.00
140 | 2025 |ISUZU - TRAVIZ MT DSL NKP 2470 8,491 ARC WHITE BAGUMBAYAN 997,000.00
141 | 2025 |ISUZU - TRAVIZ MT DSL NLA 2853 5,202 ARC WHITE BAGUMBAYAN 1,002,000.00
142 | 2024 |MAZDA -Cx8 AT GAS CDA 5607 4,123 | DEEP CRYSTAL BLUE BAGUMBAYAN 1,975,000.00
143 | 2017 |Mitsubishi - Adventure MT DSL FAM 8593 126,410 MAJESTIC RED BAGUMBAYAN 393,000.00
144 | 2024 |Mitsubishi - L300 FB MT DSL NKI 8409 64,411 POLAR WHITE BAGUMBAYAN 570,000.00
145 | 2024 |Mitsubishi - L300 FB MT DSL NFM 5735 14,179 POLAR WHITE BAGUMBAYAN 729,000.00
146 | 2025 |Mitsubishi - L300 FB MT DSL NEZ 5860 22,645 POLAR WHITE BAGUMBAYAN 786,000.00
147 | 2025 |Mitsubishi - L300 FB MT DSL NKM 1648 15,212 POLAR WHITE BAGUMBAYAN 783,000.00
148 | 2025 |Mitsubishi - L300 FB MT DSL NKN 5749 20,153 POLAR WHITE BAGUMBAYAN 749,000.00
149 | 2025 |Mitsubishi - L300 FB MT DSL NKS 4329 29,865 POLAR WHITE BAGUMBAYAN 784,000.00
150 | 2026 |Mitsubishi - L300 FB MT DSL NJG 6482 1,213 POLAR WHITE BAGUMBAYAN 862,000.00
151 | 2021 |MITSUBISHI MIRAGE G4 GLS AT GAS NES 1380 33,184 VIRGIL GRAY BAGUMBAYAN 309,000.00
152 | 2019 |MITSUBISHI MIRAGE G4 GLX MT GAS VAA 5859 100,615 VIRGIL GRAY BAGUMBAYAN 319,000.00
153 | 2024 |MITSUBISHI MIRAGE G4 GLX AT GAS NHH 1202 55,540 | COOL SILVER METALLIC BAGUMBAYAN 448,000.00
154 | 2024 |MITSUBISHI MIRAGE G4 GLX AT GAS CCF 7761 12,78 | COOL SILVER METALLIC BAGUMBAYAN 476,000.00
155 | 2024 |MITSUBISHI MIRAGE G4 GLX AT GAS VAB 8350 32,992 | COOL SILVER METALLIC BAGUMBAYAN 502,000.00
156 | 2024 |MITSUBISHI MIRAGE G4 GLX AT GAS NKE 7425 25,926 RED METALLIC BAGUMBAYAN 447,000.00
157 | 2025 |MITSUBISHI MIRAGE G4 GLX AT GAS NKO 9613 16,717 RED METALLIC BAGUMBAYAN 568,000.00
158 | 2025 |MITSUBISHI MIRAGE G4 GLX AT GAS ccQ 2537 3,047 RED METALLIC BAGUMBAYAN 505,000.00
159 | 2025 |MITSUBISHI MIRAGE G4 GLX AT GAS NKM 9816 6,920 T'TQ’\I‘E'%’A“{SCRAY BAGUMBAYAN 562,000.00
160 | 2026 |MITSUBISHI MIRAGE G4 GLX AT GAS BAH 9243 6,223 RED METALLIC BAGUMBAYAN 646,000.00
161 | 2024 |Mitsubishi - Montero Sport AT DSL CCA 7367 42,152 WH'TSLR'(?}L‘”’SggFW'TH BAGUMBAYAN 1,348,000.00
162 | 2025 |MITSUBISHI-TRITON ATHLETE 4WD |  MT DSL VAC 4948 2615 |  WHITE DIAMOND BAGUMBAYAN 1,632,000.00
163 | 2025 | FSUBISHIXFORCE GLS 1.5G AT GAS IAG 7507 6022 |  SRAFTE ORAY. BAGUMBAYAN 1,010,000.00
164 | 2024 |MITSUBISHI - XPANDER AT GAS NGC 8721 44,803 JET BLACK MICA BAGUMBAYAN 744,000.00
165 | 2024 |MITSUBISHI - XPANDER AT GAS NHG 1050 32,874 | BLADE SILVER METALLIC BAGUMBAYAN 808,000.00
166 | 2025 |MITSUBISHI - XPANDER AT GAS IAG 6481 2,105 GRAMPE%IEL?CRAY BAGUMBAYAN 905,000.00
167 | 2024 |MITSUBISHI-XPANDER CROSS 1.52| AT GAS MBF 3093 31,793 m;iﬁ'fg@fyfg BAGUMBAYAN 747,000.00
168 | 2021 |Nissan- NAVARA AT DSL ZAC 2887 99,332 | LUNAR METALLIC GRAY BAGUMBAYAN 753,000.00
169 | 2025 |Nissan- NAVARA MT DSL IAG 1277 12,802 | LUNAR METALLIC GRAY BAGUMBAYAN 1,050,000.00
170 | 2025 |Nissan- NAVARA AT DSL NLB 6239 25223 | Lunar Metallic Gray BAGUMBAYAN 1,181,000.00
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171 | 2025 |Nissan- NAVARA AT DSL CCQ 2096 6,523 GALAXY BLACK BAGUMBAYAN 1,377,000.00
172 | 2025 |SUZUKI-CARRY CABAND CHAUTI|  MT GAS IAG 3086 2,035 WHITE BAGUMBAYAN 504,000.00
173 | 2025 |SUZUKI-CARRY CABAND CHAUTI|  MTDSL NKG 9754 4,165 White BAGUMBAYAN 522,000.00
174 | 2024 |Suzuki- DZIRE AT GAS IAF 3354 13,248 RED BAGUMBAYAN 398,000.00
175 | 2024 |Suzuki- Ertiga AT GAS DNW 3976 65,335 ME'—'—OFV,VEEFELEP RED BAGUMBAYAN 762,000.00
176 | 2022 |SUZUKI-XL7 AT GAS CBE 4741 66,806 Orange BAGUMBAYAN 599,000.00
177 | 2019 |Toyota - Hi-Lux 4x2 MT DSL NEF 4033 186,430 |  FREEDOM WHITE BAGUMBAYAN 784,000.00
178 | 2024 |TOYOTA-HILLUX 4X2 2.4G AT PICK AT DSL EAG 6863 38,025 | ATTITUDE BLACK MICA BAGUMBAYAN 1,161,000.00
LAS PINAS WAREHOUSE
Grey gate w/ hexagon logo beside Colours Town Center, along Zapote Road, Las Pifias City
(Waze /| Google Map : RCBC Las Pinas Warehouse)
179 | 2024 |CHANGAN - CS35 PLUS SUV AT GAS NKK 5070 19,504 | WHITE Egg,\_f BLACK LAS PINAS 742,000.00
180 | 2025 |Ford - Everest AT DSL NKP 7276 9,212 METEOR GRAY LAS PINAS 1,908,000.00
181 | 2025 |Honda - City AT GAS NKN 3368 13,842 | LUNAR SILVER METALLIC LAS PINAS 743,000.00
182 | 2026 |Hyundai - Stargazer 1.5 GL IVT AT GAS DCD 2141 7,584 BLACK LAS PINAS 864,000.00
183 | 2025 |Isuzu - D-Max AT DSL NKN 9894 13,736 SPLASH WHITE LAS PINAS 1,243,000.00
184 | 2022 |ISUZU- QKR 77 MT DSL NIB 1373 13,539 ARC WHITE LAS PINAS 819,000.00
185 | 2023 |ISUZU - TRAVIZ MT DSL NIR 6931 27,478 ARC WHITE LAS PINAS 801,000.00
186 | 2025 |ISUZU - TRAVIZ MT DSL NKG 8346 18,922 ARC WHITE LAS PINAS 953,000.00
187 | 2025 |MG - GT 1.5L ALPHA 4SEDAN AT GAS DCA 8043 4,384 BLACK LAS PINAS 602,000.00
188 | 2025 |MG-ZS 1.5L CVT SUV AT GAS EAL 3575 854 WHITE LAS PINAS 678,000.00
189 | 2021 |Mitsubishi - L300 FB MT DSL NES 3241 ; POLAR WHITE LAS PINAS 316,000.00
190 | 2024 |Mitsubishi - L300 FB MT DSL NIP 1961 65,934 POLAR WHITE LAS PINAS 565,000.00
191 | 2024 |Mitsubishi - L300 FB MT DSL NFM 5518 47,744 POLAR WHITE LAS PINAS 651,000.00
102 | 2025 |Mitsubishi - L300 FB MT DSL NKH 7441 34,956 POLAR WHITE LAS PINAS 705,000.00
103 | 2025 |Mitsubishi - L300 FB MT DSL NJF 4961 56,770 POLAR WHITE LAS PINAS 656,000.00
194 | 2025 |Mitsubishi - L300 FB MT DSL NKN 6021 34,968 POLAR WHITE LAS PINAS 770,000.00
195 | 2025 |Mitsubishi - L300 FB MT DSL NKP 2043 24,616 POLAR WHITE LAS PINAS 671,000.00
196 | 2025 |Mitsubishi - L300 FB MT DSL IAG 1994 6,771 POLAR WHITE LAS PINAS 701,000.00
197 | 2025 |Mitsubishi - L300 FB MT DSL NKK 6676 20,569 POLAR WHITE LAS PINAS 641,000.00
198 | 2025 |Mitsubishi - L300 FB MT DSL NKQ 4629 52,495 POLAR WHITE LAS PINAS 675,000.00
199 | 2025 |Mitsubishi - L300 FB MT DSL NKQ 3997 13,614 POLAR WHITE LAS PINAS 799,000.00
200 | 2026 |Mitsubishi - L300 FB MT DSL NKT 6024 8,277 POLAR WHITE LAS PINAS 853,000.00
201| 2026 |Mitsubishi - L300 FB MT DSL NLA 7681 1,961 POLAR WHITE LAS PINAS 880,000.00
202 | 2024 |MITSUBISHI MIRAGE G4 GLS AT GAS NHQ 9839 66,976 RED METALLIC LAS PINAS 530,000.00
203 | 2020 |MITSUBISHI MIRAGE G4 GLX MT GAS EAF 8147 62,820 COOL SILVER LAS PINAS 289,000.00
204 | 2024 |MITSUBISHI MIRAGE G4 GLX AT GAS NFF 9086 30,294 | COOL SILVER METALLIC LAS PINAS 442,000.00
205 | 2024 |MITSUBISHI MIRAGE G4 GLX AT GAS DBQ 8799 32,849 T'TQ’\I‘E'#’A"{L?CRAY LAS PINAS 445,000.00
206 | 2024 |MITSUBISHI MIRAGE G4 GLX AT GAS DBQ 2303 13,283 RED METALLIC LAS PINAS 467,000.00
207 | 2024 |MITSUBISHI MIRAGE G4 GLX AT GAS IAG 1910 28,425 T'TQ’\I‘E'%’A“{LG'CRAY LAS PINAS 478,000.00
208 | 2025 |MITSUBISHI MIRAGE G4 GLX AT GAS DBT 6204 14,073 T'TQ’\I‘E'%’A“{LG'CRAY LAS PINAS 566,000.00
209 | 2025 |MITSUBISHI MIRAGE G4 GLX MT GAS EAJ 9921 5,393 T'TQ’\I‘E'%’A“{LG'CRAY LAS PINAS 576,000.00
210 | 2025 |MITSUBISHI MIRAGE G4 GLX AT GAS EAJ 9164 16,302 T o SRAY LAS PINAS 579,000.00
211 | 2025 |Mitsubishi - Montero Sport MT DSL DCA 3564 10,733 WHITE DIAMOND LAS PINAS 1,113,000.00
212 | 2025 |Mitsubishi - Montero Sport MT DSL NJE2490 59,593 | BLADE SILVER METALLIC LAS PINAS 1,016,000.00
213 | 2024 |MITSUBISHI-TRITON GLX 2WD ATM| AT DSL DBQ 6394 24,828 JET BLACK MICA LAS PINAS 1,001,000.00
214 | 2025 |MITSUBISHI - XPANDER MT GAS NKQ 6671 7,170 JET BLACK MICA LAS PINAS 809,000.00
215 | 2025 |MITSUBISHI - XPANDER AT GAS NKA 7868 9,976 | QUARTZ WHITE PEARL LAS PINAS 939,000.00
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216 | 2025 |MITSUBISHI - XPANDER AT GAS NGC 8803 27,939 | QUARTZ WHITE PEARL LAS PINAS 824,000.00
217 | 2025 |MITSUBISHI - XPANDER AT GAS DBP 9367 59,486 | QUARTZ WHITE PEARL LAS PINAS 784,000.00
218 | 2025 |MITSUBISHI - XPANDER AT GAS NKT 6922 1,525 RVAM LAS PINAS 902,000.00
219 | 2025 |MITSUBISHI - XPANDER AT GAS DCA 5021 6,142 | QUARTZ WHITE PEARL LAS PINAS 865,000.00
220 | 2025 |MITSUBISHI-XPANDER CROSS 1.52| AT GAS NEZ 7125 9,265 | QUARTZ IIHITE PEARL LAS PINAS 990,000.00
221| 2024 |MORRIS GARAGES - MG 5 AT GAS NKC 6248 15,246 Red LAS PINAS 435,000.00
222 | 2025 |MORRIS GARAGES - MG 5 AT GAS NKP 2373 22,154 Black LAS PINAS 476,000.00
223 | 2023 |MORRIS GARAGES - ZS ALPHA ATGAS | AA504A/NFS 1014 23,760 | EXTREME SPEED RED LAS PINAS 523,000.00
224 | 2025 |MORRIS GARAGES - ZS STYLE AT GAS DCA 3731 3,825 | EXTREME SPEED RED LAS PINAS 612,000.00
225 | 2024 |NISSAN - LIVINA 1.5 VL MPV AT GAS DBQ 7049 49,297 | MOONSTONE GREY LAS PINAS 818,000.00
226 | 2025 |Nissan- NAVARA AT DSL DCA 4360 4,854 ALPINE WHITE LAS PINAS 1,092,000.00
227 | 2025 |Nissan- NAVARA ATDSL | VH186A/CDA 2147 16,803 | ASPEN PEARL WHITE LAS PINAS 1,292,000.00
228 | 2025 |Nissan- NAVARA ATDSL | VD 045A/ BAH 3018 8,087 | STEALTH PEARL GRAY LAS PINAS 1,439,000.00
220 | 2026 |Nissan - TERRA AT DSL NJJ 2350 8,868 GALAXY BLACK LAS PINAS 1,837,000.00
230 | 2025 \'\/‘A'\S’\‘SAN'URVAN 2.5 STANDARD MT DSL DBU 6477 4,729 Gun Metallic LAS PINAS 1,238,000.00
231 | 2025 \'\/‘A'\S’\‘SAN'URVAN 2.5 STANDARD MT DSL NJJ 2499 5253 |  BRILLIANT SILVER LAS PINAS 1,276,000.00
232 | 2025 |Suzuki- DZIRE AT GAS NKE 4482 14,343 BLUE LAS PINAS 498,000.00
233 | 2025 |Suzuki- DZIRE AT GAS EAH 2024 15,471 GRAY LAS PINAS 568,000.00
234 | 2025 ﬁ%gﬁgipRESSO GLAGS ATGAS | KP 485A/ NKE 1473 17,524 Gray LAS PINAS 515,000.00
235 | 2026 |SUZUKI-S-PRESSO GLAGS AT GAS NLB 3426 7,187 SOLID FIRE RED LAS PINAS 553,000.00
HATCHBA
236 | 2026 |TOYOTA-AVANZA G1.5 CVT MPV ATGAS | RAT717B/DCE 9535 806 | SILVER METALLIC 4 LAS PINAS 944,000.00
237 | 2020 |TOYOTA-HIACE CMMTR 3.0MT MPV|  MT DSL NGJ 8273 161,505 |  SILVER METALLIC LAS PINAS 840,000.00
238 | 2021 |Toyota - Hi-Lux 4x2 MT DSL NGO 6622 60,065 | ATTITUDE BLACK MICA LAS PINAS 791,000.00
239 | 2025 |TOYOTA-RUSH 1.5 G AIT AT GAS DBT 6589 5,352 Black Metallic 1 LAS PINAS 916,000.00
240 | 2024 |Toyota - Vios AT GAS DBM7460 39,227 BLACK 1 LAS PINAS 496,000.00

SILANG (CAVITE) WAREHOUSE
Along Maguyam Road, Silang, Cavite

(Waze / Google Map: RCBC Warehouse Silang Cavite)

241| 2023 |Honda - BRV AT GAS NKD 4983 31,550 | CRYSTAL BLACK PEARL SILANG 857,000.00
242 | 2018 |Honda - Civic AT GAS NEH 2879 30,681 LUNAR SILVER SILANG 761,000.00
243 | 2022 |Hyundai- H100 MT DSL DAP 7713 ; CREAMY WHITE SILANG 398,000.00
244 | 2025 |Hyundai- Stargazer 1.5 GLS IV ATGAS | MK864A/DCC 2260 4,648 SILVER/BLACK SILANG 807,000.00
245 | 2024 |ISUZU - TRAVIZ MT DSL NKE 1709 35,738 ARC WHITE SILANG 850,000.00
246 | 2025 |ISUZU - TRAVIZ MT DSL NKP 5217 28,244 ARC WHITE SILANG 948,000.00
247 | 2025 |IsuUzU - TRAVIZ MT DSL NKE 6286 53,680 ARC WHITE SILANG 917,000.00
248 | 2023 |Mercedes Benz - A200 AMG AT GAS NKD 4496 6,306 POLAR WHITE SILANG 1,785,000.00
249 | 2024 |Mitsubishi - L300 FB MT DSL NKB 8335 79,752 POLAR WHITE SILANG 578,000.00
250 | 2025 |Mitsubishi - L300 FB MT DSL NKM 6634 26,719 POLAR WHITE SILANG 786,000.00
251| 2025 |Mitsubishi - L300 FB MT DSL IAG 2102 31,065 White SILANG 757,000.00
252 | 2025 |Mitsubishi - L300 FB MT DSL NJE 4106 29,968 POLAR WHITE SILANG 690,000.00
253 | 2026 |Mitsubishi - L300 FB MT DSL NLA 8271 18,036 POLAR WHITE SILANG 866,000.00
254 | 2026 |Mitsubishi - L300 FB MT DSL NKU 2572 16,300 POLAR WHITE SILANG 801,000.00
255 | 2025 |MITSUBISHI MIRAGE G4 GLS AT GAS NEZ 6154 19,639 RED METALLIC SILANG 564,000.00
256 | 2024 |MITSUBISHI MIRAGE G4 GLX AT GAS NKG 1955 20,822 T'TQ"I‘E'%’A“{LG'CRAY SILANG 480,000.00
257 | 2025 |MITSUBISHI MIRAGE G4 GLX AT GAS NJQ 2921 17,996 T'TQ"I‘E'%’A“{LG'CRAY SILANG 557,000.00
258 | 2025 |MITSUBISHI MIRAGE G4 GLX AT GAS DBS 4257 12,449 T'TQ"I‘E'%’A“{LG'CRAY SILANG 585,000.00
259 | 2025 |MITSUBISHI - XPANDER AT GAS NJQ 3848 5,951 GRE‘E’#E&%\‘ZE SILANG 946,000.00
260 | 2025 |MITSUBISHI-XPANDER CROSS 1.52| AT GAS DBT 6018 1,685 R LAY SILANG 928,000.00
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261 | 2024 |NISSAN - KICKS E POWER VL AT GAS DBV 1609 18,373 CAY;E“A%EKRRESOV’;“TH SILANG 846,000.00
262 | 2025 |Nissan- NAVARA AT DSL CCG 2652 14,803 White SILANG 1,311,000.00
263 | 2025 |Nissan- NAVARA AT DSL DBU 9219 19,468 FIERY RED SILANG 1,280,000.00
264 | 2024 |NISSAN - TERRA 2.5L VL 4xd4 A/T AT DSL CCG 4650 4,969 | LUNAR METALLIC GRAY SILANG 1,803,000.00
265 | 2024 | SSANURVAN 2.5 STANDARD AT DSL NHQ 4440 28,491 PEARL WHITE SILANG 1,506,000.00
266 | 2024 |NISSAN-Z3.0L AT GAS DCA 2240 1,993 | KAZUCH) VELLOT WITH SILANG 2,981,000.00
267 | 2024 |Suzuki- DZIRE AT GAS FAR 2005 18,991 BLUE SILANG 463,000.00
268 | 2025 |SUZUKI-XL7 AT GAS DCA 8487 5,040 GRAY SILANG 936,000.00
269 | 2026 |LOVOTATFORTUNER 2.4G AT AT DSL DCD 4174 18,952 GRAY METALLIC SILANG 1,536,000.00
270 | 2025 |TOYOTA- RAIZE 1.2 G CVT SUV AT GAS DBR 4290 13,105 RED 2 SILANG 756,000.00
271 | 2026 |Toyota - Vios AT GAS DCC 6162 12,971 GRAY,'V?;T/?I'II‘_JEM'CA SILANG 775,000.00
BULACAN WAREHOUSE
National Road, Maharlika Highway AH-26, Bgry. Sta. Rita, Guiginto, Bulacan
(Waze / Google Map: RCBC Bulacan Warehouse)
272 | 2020 |Chevrolet - Colorado AT DSL IAC 7499 ; Orange BULACAN 313,000.00
273 | 2023 |Honda - BRV AT GAS NIS 4372 45,405 | LUNAR SILVER METALLIC BULACAN 766,000.00
274 | 2023 |IsUzU - TRAVIZ MT DSL NIJ7875 38,355 ARC WHITE BULACAN 762,000.00
275 | 2025 |IsUzU - TRAVIZ MT DSL CCF 7020 43,292 ARC WHITE BULACAN 907,000.00
276 | 2022 |JAC-PRINCE ALUMINUM VAN MT DSL NIC 5314 124,122 White BULACAN 776,000.00
277 | 2024 |Mitsubishi - L300 FB MT DSL NFM 2513 10,619 POLAR WHITE BULACAN 750,000.00
278 | 2025 |Mitsubishi - L300 FB MT DSL DBT 6844 24,608 POLAR WHITE BULACAN 735,000.00
279 | 2025 |Mitsubishi - L300 FB MT DSL NKK 2112 3,873 POLAR WHITE BULACAN 800,000.00
280 | 2025 |Mitsubishi - L300 FB MT DSL NJQ 2548 11,654 Polar White BULACAN 691,000.00
281| 2025 |Mitsubishi - L300 FB MT DSL NKL 9275 34,261 POLAR WHITE BULACAN 858,000.00
282 | 2024 |MITSUBISHI MIRAGE G4 GLX AT GAS NHH 1149 68,808 T o SRAY BULACAN 497,000.00
283 | 2024 |MITSUBISHI MIRAGE G4 GLX AT GAS NKJ 7114 20,281 T o SRAY BULACAN 513,000.00
284 | 2025 |MITSUBISHI MIRAGE G4 GLX AT GAS CCG 2621 18,430 Red Mettalic BULACAN 529,000.00
285 | 2025 |MITSUBISHI MIRAGE G4 GLX AT GAS ccQ 2520 3,051 RED METALLIC BULACAN 571,000.00
286 | 2025 |MITSUBISHI MIRAGE G4 GLX AT GAS CCQ 4809 8,535 RED METALLIC BULACAN 567,000.00
287 | 2026 |MITSUBISHI MIRAGE G4 GLX AT GAS DCC 8997 5,989 RED METALLIC BULACAN 658,000.00
288 | 2025 y\l'\ITES)UB'SH"XFORCE GLS 1.5G AT GAS NKN 5879 7,426 | BLADE 3\'/'T¥EFEI':”AETA'—'—'C BULACAN 1,007,000.00
289 | 2023 |MITSUBISHI - XPANDER AT GAS NIP 3553 40,899 RED METTALIC BULACAN 748,000.00
290 | 2025 |MITSUBISHI - XPANDER AT GAS CDA 4245 4,889 | QUARTZ WHITE PEARL BULACAN 901,000.00
291 | 2025 |Nissan - Almera AT GAS DBR 7794 11,053 | MOON FEARL ORAVWITH BULACAN 832,000.00
202 | 2023 |Nissan- NAVARA AT DSL BAF 1946 sg116 | FORGED FETALLIC BULACAN 905,000.00
203 | 2024 |Nissan- NAVARA AT DSL CCA 8648 9,619 GALAZXY BLACK BULACAN 1,004,000.00
204 | 2025 |Nissan- NAVARA AT DSL DCA 1402 6,817 Pearl White BULACAN 1,611,000.00
205 | 2025 |Nissan- NAVARA AT DSL CCG 2679 10,687 Gray BULACAN 1,100,000.00
296 | 2026 |Nissan- NAVARA ATDSL | FE 565B / CDA 8764 4,232 FORGgODP"gE;A'—'—'C BULACAN 1,438,000.00
207 | 2025 |Nissan - TERRA AT DSL IAG 1232 4771 Aspen Pearl White BULACAN 1,654,000.00
208 | 2025 |Nissan - TERRA AT DSL cca 1784 10,837 PEARL GRAY BULACAN 1,723,000.00
299 | 2025 |NISSAN - TERRA 2.5L VE 4x2 A/T AT DSL BAG 7937 23,511 | LUNAR METALLIC GRAY BULACAN 1,348,000.00
300 | 2025 \'\/‘A'\S’\‘SAN'URVAN 2.5 STANDARD MT DSL CCG 9167 4,343 GRANITE BLACK BULACAN 1,255,000.00
301| 2025 |SUZUKI-CARRY CABAND CHAUTI|  MT GAS NKJ 9857 54,102 White BULACAN 493,000.00
302 | 2025 |Suzuki- Ertiga AT GAS BNV 1171 29,733 White BULACAN 876,000.00
303 | 2025 |Suzuki- Jimny AT GAS BAG 7096 9,736 Red/Black BULACAN 1,395,000.00
304 | 2024 ﬁ%gﬁgipRESSO GLAGS AT GAS IAF 7889 ; Gray BULACAN 497,000.00
305| 2019 |Toyota - Vios AT GAS CBC 1645 87,502 Red BULACAN 476,000.00
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306 | 2024 |Toyota - Vios AT GAS CCA 5258 26,588 SUPER RED V BULACAN 582,000.00
CANDUMAN (CEBU) WAREHOUSE
VSEF Warehouse Canduman, Sitio Apas Riverside Canduman, Mandaue City, Cebu
(Waze /| Google Map: DJ Nino Hardware & Junkshop Hardware Store. Cebu-Canduman Warehouse is just across it.)
307 | 2024 |Changan - CS55 Plus Luxe 1.5 D ATGAS  |BS 324A/ GBK 6383 10,467 Black CANDUMAN 794,000.00
308 | 2021 |Ford - Ranger MT DSL HAC 6565 99,522 BLUE LIGHTNING CANDUMAN 574,000.00
309 | 2021 |Ford - Ranger MT DSL GAU 3216 42,306 | ALUMINUM METALLIC CANDUMAN 701,000.00
310| 2024 |Ford - Ranger MT DSL HAH 3961 13,460 |  ABSOLUTE BLACK CANDUMAN 1,091,000.00
311 | 2025 |Ford - Ranger AT DSL HAG 8918 28,261 |  ABSOLUTE BLACK CANDUMAN 1,224,000.00
312| 2025 |Ford - Ranger AT DSL HAH 8320 38,681 METEOR GRAY CANDUMAN 1,503,000.00
313| 2025 |Ford - Ranger AT DSL GBI 6231 5,805 Meteor Gray CANDUMAN 1,248,000.00
314| 2024 |FOTON - HARABAS TM300 MPV MT DSL HAH 5916 8,583 WHITE CANDUMAN 686,000.00
315| 2025 |Honda - City AT GAS NHT 2110 16,674 METE%?&B SRAY CANDUMAN 704,000.00
316 | 2022 gxgggﬁl-moo 2.5CRDI GL MT DSL NGY 4774 32,048 CREAMY WHITE CANDUMAN 563,000.00
317 | 2021 [ISUZU - TRAVIZ MT DSL HAC 9342 128,478 ARC WHITE CANDUMAN 578,000.00
318 | 2025 [ISUZU - TRAVIZ MT DSL HAH 9716 6,154 ARC WHITE CANDUMAN 928,000.00
319 | 2025 [ISUZU - TRAVIZ MT DSL GBK 1702 27,345 ARC WHITE CANDUMAN 903,000.00
320 | 2025 [ISUZU - TRAVIZ MT DSL HAJ 1317 7,032 ARC WHITE CANDUMAN 1,047,000.00
321| 2023 |JMC - JMKS MT DSL HAG 9093 3,631 WHITE CANDUMAN 924,000.00
322| 2024 |MG-zSTSUV AT GAS HAH 9779 2,524 Blue CANDUMAN 714,000.00
323 | 2025 |Mitsubishi - L300 FB MT DSL HAH 7743 15,608 POLAR WHITE CANDUMAN 746,000.00
324 | 2023 |MITSUBISHI MIRAGE G4 GLX AT GAS LAL 5646 34,738 T'TQ’\I‘E'%’A“{LG'CRAY CANDUMAN 408,000.00
325| 2025 |MITSUBISHI MIRAGE G4 GLX AT GAS GBB 2002 16,218 | COOL SILVER METALLIC CANDUMAN 538,000.00
326 | 2025 |MITSUBISHI MIRAGE G4 GLX AT GAS GBI 6033 6,226 T o SRAY CANDUMAN 580,000.00
327 | 2025 |Mitsubishi - Montero Sport AT DSL GBI 4939 12,885 | BLADE SILVER METALLIC CANDUMAN 1,541,000.00
328 | 2025 |Mitsubishi - Montero Sport MT DSL GBI 2402 7,516 | BLADE SILVER METALLIC CANDUMAN 1,108,000.00
329 | 2025 |Mitsubishi - Montero Sport AT DSL GBI 8267 16,591 |  Blade Silver Metallic CANDUMAN 1,129,000.00
330 | 2025 |MITSUBISHI - XPANDER AT GAS GBI 8659 8332 | JRSE ORINGE CANDUMAN 1,002,000.00
331| 2024 |MITSUBISHI-XPANDER GLX 1.5G AT GAS HAH 3308 15,374 GRAMPE%IEL?CRAY CANDUMAN 806,000.00
332| 2020 |Nissan - Almera AT GAS FAL 8178 90,634 |  BRILLIANT SILVER CANDUMAN 351,000.00
333| 2025 |Nissan - Grand Livina AT GAS HAJ 3188 6,069 SILVER CANDUMAN 947,000.00
334 | 2025 |NISSAN - LIVINA 1.5 VE MPV AT GAS HAJ 2061 17,131 Silver CANDUMAN 888,000.00
335| 2025 |NISSAN - LIVINA 1.5 VL MPV AT GAS HAJ 2060 5,066 SILVER CANDUMAN 880,000.00
336 | 2024 |Nissan- TERRA AT DSL KBB 6427 14,768 FIERY RED CANDUMAN 1,775,000.00
337 | 2025 \'\/‘A'\S’\‘SAN'URVAN 2.5 STANDARD MT DSL HAH 9011 20,273 ALPINE WHITE CANDUMAN 1,316,000.00
338 | 2025 |Suzuki- APV MT GAS HAH 5040 13,780 SILVER CANDUMAN 666,000.00
339 | 2024 |Suzuki- Ertiga AT GAS HNV 1427 31,528 White CANDUMAN 762,000.00
340 | 2025 |SUZUKI-S-PRESSO GLAGS AT GAS GBJ 8598 4,821 White CANDUMAN 501,000.00
HATCHBA
341 | 2026 |SUZUKI-S-PRESSO GLAGS AT GAS HAJ 3041 1,008 GRAY CANDUMAN 582,000.00
HATCHBA
342 | 2025 |Toyota - Hi-Ace GL Grandia MT DSL GBJ 4421 15,557 | SILVER MICA METALLIC CANDUMAN 1,884,000.00
343 | 2025 |TOYOTA-HILLUX 4X2 2.4G AT PICK AT DSL GBK 8700 1,576 GRAY METALLIC CANDUMAN 1,410,000.00
344 | 2025 |TOYOTA- HILUX CONQUEST AT DSL GBJ7677 32,546 GRAY METALLIC CANDUMAN 1,434,000.00
345| 2023 |Toyota - Rush AT GAS EAG 4344 7,809 |  BLACK METALLIC 1 CANDUMAN 801,000.00
346 | 2019 |Toyota - Wigo MT GAS HAB 9680 149,005 | ORANGE METALLIC CANDUMAN 246,000.00
347 | 2020 |Toyota - Wigo MT GAS GAN 8485 120,217 RED CANDUMAN 253,000.00
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348 | 2021 |Toyota - Wigo AT GAS HAC 7376 147111 |  ORANGE METALLIC CANDUMAN 347,000.00
BACOLOD WAREHOUSE
Dana Land, #22, Lacson St., Capitol Subsi on, Bacolod City
(Waze / Google Map: RCBC Auto Bacolod Warehouse)
349 | 2024 |Ford - Ranger AT DSL FAQ 8450 30,067 |  ABSOLUTE BLACK BACOLOD 1,072,000.00
350 | 2025 |Hyundai- Stargazer 1.5 GL IVT AT GAS FAS 3132 3,763 WHITE BACOLOD 877,000.00
351| 2024 |MITSUBISHI MIRAGE G4 GLX AT GAS FAQ 3592 41,710 | COOL SILVER METALLIC BACOLOD 440,000.00
352 | 2020 |MITSUBISHI-STRADA GLS 2.4D 2WD|  MT DSL NGM 1926 71,387 R LAY BACOLOD 602,000.00
353 | 2021 |gioUBISH! - XPANDER GLS AT GAS FAF 3239 59,659 R LAY BACOLOD 718,000.00
354 | 2025 |Nissan - Urvan MT DSL GBL 1467 12,867 ALPINE WHITE BACOLOD 1,207,000.00
355| 2021 |Toyota - Avanza AT GAS FAF 3765 29,528 Champagne BACOLOD 583,000.00
356 | 2025 |TOYOTA- HILUX CONQUEST AT DSL FAS 5945 41,100 SUPER WHITE Il BACOLOD 1,277,000.00

ILOILO - LEGANES WAREHOUSE

Cor. Sta Barbara Airport Road, Brgy. San Vicente, Leganes, lloilo City

(Waze / Google Map: St. Peter Chapels lloilo. llolo-Leganes Warehouse is just across it.)

357 | 2021 |Cherry - Tiggo AT GAS FAI 9366 21,540 WHITE ILOILO LEGANES 449,000.00
358 | 2024 |CHERY - TIGGO 5X AT GAS FAS 1784 11,197 WHITE ILOILO LEGANES 524,000.00
359 | 2018 |Chevrolet - Sail MT GAS FAE 4731 38,005 |  SILVER METALLIC ILOILO LEGANES 247,000.00
360 | 2025 |FORD-RANGER 2.0L TURBOXLT4 | AT DSL NKS 8353 5989 | ABSOLUTE BLACK ILOILO LEGANES 1,170,000.00
361| 2022 |FOTON - HARABAS TM300 MPV MT DSL FAO 8076 90,419 White ILOILO LEGANES 515,000.00
362 | 2024 |GAC-GS32024 EMZOOM RSTYLE AT GAS FAR 1745 9,726 |  GRAPHENE GREY ILOILO LEGANES 691,000.00
363 | 2025 |Hyundai- Stargazer 1.5 GL IVT AT GAS FAS 2984 31,471 WHITE ILOILO LEGANES 680,000.00
364 | 2024 |Hyundai - Stargazer 1.5 GLS IV AT GAS FAR 5364 69,886 Silver/Black ILOILO LEGANES 663,000.00
365| 2024 |MITSUBISHI MIRAGE G4 GLX MT GAS FAR 2938 18,683 T o SRAY ILOILO LEGANES 457,000.00
366 | 2025 |Mitsubishi - Montero Sport AT DSL FAS 2038 16,742 JET BLACK MICA ILOILO LEGANES 1,413,000.00
367 | 2024 |MITSUBISHI-STRADA GLS 2.4D 2WD| AT DSL FAQ 4201 65,127 GRAMPQXEL?CRAY ILOILO LEGANES 1,050,000.00
368 | 2026 |MITSUBISHI-XPANDER CROSS 1.5 AT GAS LE 787B / NJK 8816 4,191 QUAFafngLL%EEARL ILOILO LEGANES 867,000.00
369 | 2025 |MITSUBISHI-XPANDER CROSS 1.52| AT GAS FAR 8281 8,347 QUAWI?F":";'TT(ENFI’EEAR'— ILOILO LEGANES 920,000.00
370 | 2023 |MORRIS GARAGES - MG 5 AT GAS FAR 7358 28,699 YORK WHITE ILOILO LEGANES 395,000.00
371| 2024 |Nissan- NAVARA MT DSL FAR 5815 58,992 |  BRILLIANT SILVER ILOILO LEGANES 899,000.00
372| 2019 \'\/‘A'\SI\ISAN'URVAN 2.5 STANDARD MT DSL NED 2018 107,686 ALPINE WHITE ILOILO LEGANES 658,000.00
373 | 2025 |SUZUKI-CARRY CABAND CHAUTI|  MT GAS FAS 3204 4124 White ILOILO LEGANES 570,000.00
374| 2025 |SUZUKI- CARRY DROPSIDE UTILIT|  MT GAS FAQ 6464 11,671 White ILOILO LEGANES 499,000.00
375| 2024 |Suzuki- Ertiga ATGAS  |FNV 1809/ FNV 1219 ; Red ILOILO LEGANES 750,000.00
376 | 2024 |Suzuki- Ertiga MT GAS FNV 1356 19,452 Silver ILOILO LEGANES 622,000.00
377 | 2025 |Suzuki- Ertiga AT GAS FNV 1836 46,384 WHITE ILOILO LEGANES 762,000.00
378 | 2024 |SUZUKI - S-PRESSO MT GAS FAS 7438 23,207 RED ILOILO LEGANES 359,000.00
379 | 2024 |SUZUKI - S-PRESSO 1.0 MT MT GAS FAQ 6192 40,115 White ILOILO LEGANES 403,000.00
380 | 2024 ﬁ%gﬁgipRESSO GLAGS AT GAS FAR 8336 32,123 Gray ILOILO LEGANES 492,000.00
381 2025 ﬁ%gﬁgipRESSO GLAGS AT GAS FAS 2270 30,108 Gray ILOILO LEGANES 503,000.00
382 | 2025 ﬁ%gﬁgipRESSO GLAGS AT GAS FAS 6019 15,334 Gray ILOILO LEGANES 493,000.00
383 | 2025 gﬁgOTA'FORTUNER 24G 4X2AT AT DSL FAS 8915 19,425 SUPER WHITE Il ILOILO LEGANES 1,428,000.00
384 | 2025 |TOYOTA-RAIZE 1.2 E MT SUV MT GAS FAS 8577 13,177 GRAY METALLIC ILOILO LEGANES 657,000.00
385| 2025 |TOYOTA- RAIZE 1.2 G CVT SUV AT GAS FAT 7134 9,726 RED 2 ILOILO LEGANES 800,000.00

OPOL (CAGAYAN DE ORO) WAREHOUSE

PJL Warehouse, Bonbon Opol, Misamis Oriental

(Waze / Google Map: PJL Warehouse, GH87+VJG, Opol, Misamis Oriental; Landmark: Poldo's Seaside Opol)

386 | 2022 |CHANGAN - ALSVIN 1.4L 4SEDAN AT GAS KAF 3713 47,751 RED OPOL 284,000.00
387 | 2024 |GAC-GS3 EMZOOM GS SuUvV AT GAS ZAG 1370 25,282 IVORY WHITE OPOL 667,000.00
388 | 2024 |GAC-GS3 EMZOOM GS SuvV AT GAS ZAD 5506 92,596 IVORY WHITE OPOL 684,000.00
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389 | 2024 |GAC-GS32024 EMZOOM RSTYLE AT GAS ZAF 5572 11,700 IVORY WHITE OPOL 657,000.00
390 | 2021 |Hyundai - Accent MT GAS KAF 1134 76,808 GRAY OPOL 337,000.00
391| 2024 [ISUZU - TRAVIZ MT DSL KAU 2792 18,025 ARC WHITE OPOL 943,000.00
392 | 2025 [ISUZU- TRAVIZ MT DSL NKL 2181 38,551 ARC WHITE OPOL 965,000.00
393 | 2024 [ISUZU-QLR77 EVL20 EUROIV UTIVA |  MT DSL KBB 1389 79,182 ARC WHITE OPOL 1,035,000.00
394 | 2024 |KIA-SOLUTO 1.4L LX AT SEDAN AT GAS ZAG 1374 34,524 Red OPOL 521,000.00
395| 2023 |KIA-SOLUTO 1.4L LX MT SEDAN MT GAS ZAF 4740 26,110 RED OPOL 447,000.00
396 | 2024 |Mitsubishi - L300 FB MT DSL ZAG 1038 33,069 POLAR WHITE OPOL 664,000.00
397 | 2025 |Mitsubishi - L300 FB MTDSL | TG 212A/KBD 2768 15,871 POLAR WHITE OPOL 720,000.00
398 | 2025 |MITSUBISHI MIRAGE G4 GLS AT GAS DBT 3567 27,945 | COOL SILVER METALLIC OPOL 581,000.00
399 | 2024 |MITSUBISHI MIRAGE G4 GLX AT GAS ZAG 1012 59,277 T o SRAY OPOL 464,000.00
400 | 2024 |MITSUBISHI MIRAGE G4 GLX AT GAS KAR 7041 92,114 T o SRAY OPOL 406,000.00
401| 2025 |Mitsubishi - Montero Sport MT DSL KAU 1303 32,004 |  WHITE DIAMOND OPOL 1,010,000.00
402 | 2025 |MITSUBISHI-TRITON GLS 2WDATP| AT DSL KAU 9718 17,790 | BLADE SILVER METALLIC OPOL 1,180,000.00
403 | 2025 |MITSUBISHI-TRITON GLS 2WDATP| AT DSL ZAG 5686 4,732 | BLADE SILVER METALLIC OPOL 1,208,000.00
404 | 2026 |MITSUBISHI - XPANDER ATGAS  |LG 786B /GBB 2721 11,220 | QUARTZ WHITE PEARL OPOL 1,076,000.00
405 | 2025 |MLISUBISH! - XPANDER GLS AT GAS KAU 1916 9,559 RED METALLIC OPOL 910,000.00
406 | 2025 |MITSUBISHI-XPANDER GLX 1.5G AT GAS KAU 2881 6,202 R LAY OPOL 835,000.00
407 | 2025 |MITSUBISHI-XPANDER GLX 1.5G AT GAS KAU 9834 6,461 R LAY OPOL 827,000.00
408 | 2019 |MORRIS GARAGES - ZS STYLE AT GAS FAG 3055 92,596 ORANGE OPOL 324,000.00
400 | 2021 |Nissan- NAVARA MT DSL KAG 3833 117,670 FORGgODP"gE;ALL'C OPOL 841,000.00
410 | 2024 |Nissan- NAVARA MT DSL KBB 2779 23,215 |  BRILLIANT SILVER OPOL 907,000.00
411 | 2025 |Nissan- NAVARA AT DSL LAO9373 20,596 GALAXY BLACK OPOL 1,257,000.00
412 | 2025 |Nissan- NAVARA AT DSL LAP1696 11,568 | ASPEN PEARL WHITE OPOL 1,542,000.00
413 | 2025 |Nissan- NAVARA AT DSL JAS 7926 40,176 | ASPEN PEARL WHITE OPOL 1,281,000.00
414 | 2025 |Suzuki- APV MT GAS ZAF 7854 16,860 GRAY OPOL 652,000.00
415 | 2021 |Suzuki- Ertiga MT GAS KAG 3005 39,432 SILVER OPOL 497,000.00
416 | 2021 |Suzuki- Swift MT GAS KAF 3070 ; Red OPOL 191,000.00
417 | 2023 |SUZUKI - XL7 AT GAS ZAF 2721 9,252 Gray OPOL 706,000.00
418 | 2025 |SUZUKI-XL7 AT GAS GBJ 3279 17,540 WHITE OPOL 893,000.00
419 | 2026 |TOYOTA- HI-LUX GR-S 2.8L 4X4 AT DSL KAT 2527 30,998 SA?‘IF"II‘EI'EE\:VEHBI[iC\gvK/ oPOL 2,040,000.00
420 | 2021 |Toyota - Innova MT DSL HAC 9245 32,048 |  BLACK RED MICA OPOL 959,000.00
421 2021 |Toyota - Vios AT GAS KAG 6804 109,384 BLACK OPOL 401,000.00
422| 2020 |Toyota - Wigo MT GAS KAD 6043 31,626 BLACK OPOL 295,000.00
POLOMOLOK WAREHOUSE

RCBC Polomolok Warehouse, Silway 8 - Silway 7 Rd, Polomolok, South Cotabato

(Waze / Google Map: RCBC Polomolok Warehouse. Warehouse is near Silway 8 Barangay Hall.)

423| 2023 |CHERY - TIGGO 5X AT GAS LAN 4865 41,717 RED POLOMOLOK 422,000.00
424| 2023 |FORD - TERRITORY AT GAS MAS 6369 8,442 RUBY RED POLOMOLOK 774,000.00
425| 2023 |FORD - TERRITORY AT GAS MAS 6373 59,560 PANTHER BLACK POLOMOLOK 697,000.00
426| 2024 |FORD - TERRITORY AT GAS MAW 1991 40,683 BLUE METALLIC POLOMOLOK 972,000.00
427| 2025 |GAC-GS3 EMZOOM GS SUV AT GAS MBR 1098 3,152 SALT LAKE BLUE POLOMOLOK 791,000.00
428 2023 |MG-zSTsuv AT GAS MAW 4345 36,475 Blue POLOMOLOK 508,000.00
420 | 2025 |MG-ZS 1.5L CVT SUV AT GAS MBK 5975 14,044 Black POLOMOLOK 808,000.00
430 | 2025 |Mitsubishi- L300 FB MTDSL | UN402A/ LAT 4262 1,706 POLAR WHITE POLOMOLOK 810,000.00
431| 2014 |Mitsubishi - Montero Sport AT DSL AAH 5748 174,222 SAVANNA WHITE POLOMOLOK 508,000.00
432| 2018 |Mitsubishi - Montero Sport AT DSL MAO 7058 150,409 TITANIUM GRAY POLOMOLOK 791,000.00
433 | 2025 |MITSUBISHI - XPANDER AT GAS LAQ 1671 24,754 GRAPHITE GRAY POLOMOLOK 829,000.00

METALLIC
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434 | 2023 |MORRIS GARAGES - MG 5 AT GAS MBD 1663 64,000 | EXTREME SPEED RED POLOMOLOK 350,000.00
435 | 2023 |MORRIS GARAGES - ZS STYLE AT GAS MAW 4945 28,454 RED POLOMOLOK 516,000.00
436 | 2025 |Nissan- NAVARA AT DSL MBD 3165 23,656 GALAXY BLACK POLOMOLOK 1,077,000.00
437 | 2026 |Nissan- NAVARA AT DSL LAS 3148 4,176 | STEALTH PEARL GRAY POLOMOLOK 1,991,000.00
438 | 2025 |Suzuki- DZIRE MT GAS MBD 9567 24,251 WHITE POLOMOLOK 431,000.00
430 | 2024 |Suzuki- Ertiga AT GAS MNV1184 28,794 BRAVE KHAKI POLOMOLOK 738,000.00
440 | 2024 |Suzuki- Ertiga AT GAS MNV1017 57,108 | MELLOW DEEP RED POLOMOLOK 698,000.00
441| 2025 |SUZUKI-XL7 AT GAS MBD 3131 34,427 ORANGE/BLACK POLOMOLOK 885,000.00
442 | 2025 |SUZUKI-XL7 GLXAT HYBRID TWO T| AT GAS LAQ 5614 16,010 IVORY/BLACK POLOMOLOK 902,000.00
DAVAO WAREHOUSE
Sitio Filomena, Catalunan Grande, Davao City
(Waze / Google Map: EZA Residencia. Davao Warehouse is near the area.)
443 | 2025 |Ford - Ranger AT DSL LAR 1804 18,005 ARCTIC WHITE DAVAO 1,348,000.00
444 | 2025 |GAC-GS3 EMZOOM GS SUV AT GAS LAQ 7391 14,614 IVORY WHITE DAVAO 704,000.00
445 | 2021 |GEELY - SXIl COOLRAY GF SEDAN AT GAS LAJ 1934 63,080 SILVER DAVAO 466,000.00
446 | 2024 |lsuzu - D-Max MT DSL LAP 2574 14,026 ONYX BLACK DAVAO 1,108,000.00
447 | 2024 |Mitsubishi - L300 FB MT DSL LAP 5790 69,936 POLAR WHITE DAVAO 541,000.00
448 | 2025 |Mitsubishi - L300 FB MT DSL LAQ 9379 40,609 POLAR WHITE DAVAO 803,000.00
449 | 2023 |MITSUBISHI MIRAGE G4 GLX AT GAS LAM 6499 90,295 RED METALLIC DAVAO 353,000.00
450 | 2024 |MITSUBISHI MIRAGE G4 GLX AT GAS LAP 8209 31,626 T o SRAY DAVAO 513,000.00
451| 2025 |Mitsubishi - Montero Sport AT DSL LAQ 3675 14,182 WHITE DIAMOND DAVAO 1,548,000.00
452 | 2023 |MITSUBISHI-STRADA GLS 2.4D 2WD| AT DSL LAL 6294 174,932 JET BLACK MICA DAVAO 726,000.00
453 | 2025 |MITSUBISHI-TRITON GLS 2WDATP| AT DSL LAR 8996 6,597 | BLADE SILVER METALLIC DAVAO 1,264,000.00
454 | 2025 |MITSUBISHI-TRITON GLX 2WD ATM| AT DSL LAR 2386 11,182 WHITE DIAMOND DAVAO 1,110,000.00
455 | 2024 | MITSUBISHI-TRITON GLX 2WD MT MT DSL LAP 4278 14,086 R LAY DAVAO 963,000.00
456 | 2025 |MISUBISHIXFORCE GLS 1.56 AT GAS GBI 3457 18,664 | ENEROETIC YELLOW DAVAO 990,000.00
457 | 2021 |Nissan - Almera MT GAS LAH 5464 67,519 BLUISH BLACK DAVAO 297,000.00
458 | 2025 |Nissan - Almera AT GAS ZAF 6368 11,700 GUN METTALIC DAVAO 909,000.00
450 | 2025 |NISSAN-KICKS E-POWER V SUV AT ELECTR 1101-1441163 16,612 | PEARLWHITE WITH DAVAO 1,090,000.00
BLACK ROOF
460 | 2025 |NISSAN - LIVINA 1.5 VL MPV AT GAS LAR 6052 8411 | MOONSTONE GRAY DAVAO 861,000.00
461 2019 |Nissan - NAVARA MT DSL LAF 5158 192,313 |  BRILLIANT SILVER DAVAO 478,000.00
462 | 2023 |Nissan- NAVARA AT DSL LAM 3433 77,004 GALAXY BLACK DAVAO 893,000.00
463 | 2025 |Nissan- NAVARA MT DSL LAQ 5318 6,740 | LUNAR METALLIC GRAY DAVAO 1,032,000.00
464 | 2025 |Nissan- NAVARA AT DSL KAU 6539 8,477 FIERY RED DAVAO 1,456,000.00
465 | 2021 |Nissan - TERRA AT DSL LAH 5886 103,526 | ASPEN PEARL WHITE DAVAO 1,005,000.00
466 | 2021 |Suzuki- DZIRE AT GAS LAH 2850 53,905 WHITE DAVAO 299,000.00
467 | 2025 |Suzuki- DZIRE MT GAS LAP 1799 13,613 Silver DAVAO 439,000.00
468 | 2025 |Suzuki- DZIRE AT GAS LAP 4123 33,069 GRAY DAVAO 498,000.00
469 | 2025 |SUZUKI-S-PRESSO GLAGS AT GAS MBD 6861 26,410 Gray DAVAO 505,000.00
HATCHBA
Note: Units with asterisk (*) - with special concerns that are known by the Bank
All units are sold on an AS-IS-WHERE-IS basis. Units' availability and prices are subject to change without prior notice. The Bank reserves the right to withdraw any unit without any prior notice.
Inadvertent misprints shall not alter the unit's factual condition nor shall they be d d as misinterpr ion of the unit.
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RCBC

AUTO

WAREHOUSE
GUIDE

All RCBC Auto Warehouses are open daily, from

8:30AM to 5:00PM (excluding holidays)

* Monday to Saturday: A warehouse personnel is
available to assist with the viewing and checking/
inspection.

e Sunday: A security guard onsite will assist with the
viewing only.

No need to set an appointment, walk-in clients are
welcome!

For inquiries, you may reach us thru the following

from Monday to Friday, 09:00AM to 05:00PM

(exc. holidays):

« Email: carsforsale@rcbc.com

* Mobile: 0998-868-1754 / 0918-990-3805 /
0968-259-0331

* Landline: (02)8894-9000 loc. 7752/ 7753 /

775717709
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Waze / Google Map: St. Peter Chapels lloilo

Address:

Landmark:

Cor. Sta. Barbara Airport Road, San
Vicente, Leganes, lloilo City
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REQUIREMENTS
(Applicable for CASH purchases)

FOR INDIVIDUALS

Documentary Requirements:

e Auto Reservation Form e Auto Reservation Form
(applicable for No Bid Required only) (applicable for No Bid Required only)
e Bid Form e Bid Form
(applicable for Sealed Bidding only) (applicable for Sealed Bidding only)
e Customer Relationship Form (Bank Form) e Customer Relationship Form (Bank Form)
e 2 Valid Government-Issued IDs e 2 Valid Government-Issued IDs
e TIN ID/ TIN Verification Slip e TIN ID/TIN Verification Slip
o Latest Proof of Billing e Latest Proof of Billing
o LatestBIR 2316 o DTI Business Registration
OR e Latest Income Tax Return
Eﬁrgggfeﬁzgtﬁgﬂgtpg:ar e) e Audited Financial Statement

Note: Other documents may be required upon evaluation.

FOR CORPORATIONS

Documentary Requirements:

Auto Reservation Form (applicable for No Bid Required only)

Bid Form (applicable for Sealed Bidding only)

Customer Relationship Form (for the Corporation & its authorized signatory/ies; Bank Form)

2 Valid Government-Issued IDs of Authorized Signatory/ies

TIN ID of Authorized Signatory/ies

BIR Form 2303 (BIR Certificate of Registration)

Latest Community Tax Certificate (CEDULA)

SEC Certificate of Registration

SEC Articles of Incorporation & By-Laws

Latest SEC General Information Sheet (GIS)

Latest BIR Form 1702 (Income Tax Return)

Audited Financial Statement

Notarized Secretary’s Certificate (Authorizing the purchase and designation of its authorized
signatory/ies)

Note: Other documents may be required upon evaluation.




REQUIREMENTS

(Applicable for purchases via Auto Loan)

FOR INDIVIDUALS

Eligibility:

Filipino or Dual Citizen

Filipino or Dual Citizen

At least 21 years old upon loan
application

At least 21 years old upon loan application

At most 70 years old upon loan maturity

At most 70 years old upon loan maturity

Must have a mobile number and a
residence or office landline

Must have a mobile number and a
residence or office landline

With a minimum employment tenure of 1
year and minimum gross monthly income
of Php40,000.00

Business must be in profitable operations
for the past 2 years

Documentary Requirements:

Auto Loan Application Form (Bank Form)

Auto Loan Application Form (Bank Form)

Auto Reservation Form
(applicable for No Bid Required only)

Auto Reservation Form
(applicable for No Bid Required only)

Bid Form
(applicable for Sealed Bidding only)

Bid Form
(applicable for Sealed Bidding only)

Customer Relationship Form (Bank Form)

Customer Relationship Form (Bank Form)

2 Valid Government-Issued IDs

2 Valid Government-Issued IDs

TIN ID / TIN Verification Slip

TIN ID / TIN Verification Slip

Latest Proof of Billing (Utility Bill)

Latest Proof of Billing (Utility Bill)

Latest BIR 2316
OR

Certificate of Employment
(w/ Compensation & Tenure)

DTI Business Registration

Audited Financial Statement

Latest Income Tax Return or Bank
Statements

Note: Other documents may be required upon evaluation.




