


No. Model Brand / Variant Transmission Plate # Mileage  Color  Warehouse Selling Price

1 2024 CHERY - TIGGO 5X              AT GAS NIS 6603 5,121         GRAY PASIG                   540,000.00 

2 2020 FORD - ECOSPORT               AT GAS CAT 8536 50,939       RUBY RED PASIG                   477,000.00 

3 2023 HONDA - BRV                   AT GAS NIL 7207 19,166       
CRYSTAL BLACK 

PEARL
PASIG                   824,000.00 

4 2020 HONDA - CITY                  MT GAS NGD 4317 58,939       TAFFETA WHITE PASIG                   401,000.00 

5 2019 HONDA - CITY                  AT GAS
NBD9046 / 

E1I743
106,789     

MODEN STEEL 

METTALIC
PASIG                   456,000.00 

6 2014 HYUNDAI - EON                 MT GAS AAX 2534 142,869     MUSHROOM PASIG                   170,000.00 

7 2023 ISUZU - NLR 85                AT DSL NHG 4050 8,795         ARC WHITE PASIG                1,193,000.00 

8 2019 ISUZU - QKR 77                MT DSL BAB 8838 105,620     ARC WHITE PASIG                   687,000.00 

9 2024 MITSUBISHI - XPANDER          AT GAS NFF 3215 6,606         RED METALLIC PASIG                   843,000.00 

10 2024 MITSUBISHI MIRAGE G4 GLS      AT GAS NKI 6255 11,457       RED METALLIC PASIG                   540,000.00 

12 2024 NISSAN -  NAVARA              AT DSL F6 Q054 21,125       GALAXY BLACK PASIG                1,229,000.00 

13 2021 SUZUKI - ERTIGA               AT GAS BAE 7413 54,409       GRAY PASIG                   538,000.00 

15 2019 TOYOTA - INNOVA               AT DSL IAC 9655 90,424       THERMALYTE PASIG                   725,000.00 

16 2023 GAC - EMPOW GB SEDAN          AT GAS NKK 7993 6,333         MOONLIGHT GREY BAGUMBAYAN                   603,000.00 

17 2023 GEELY - COOLRAY               AT GAS CCC 1835 30,085       RED BAGUMBAYAN                   608,000.00 

18 2023 GEELY - COOLRAY               AT GAS CCC 8302 23,676       WHITE BAGUMBAYAN                   626,000.00 

19 2018 HONDA - CITY                  AT GAS NAV8945 83,712       CRYSTAL BLACK BAGUMBAYAN                   385,000.00 

20 2015 HONDA - CRV                   AT GAS
AAW 3114 / DP 

2365
101,254     WHITE ORCHID PEARL BAGUMBAYAN                   538,000.00 

21 2016 HONDA - MOBILIO               AT GAS NCE 2605 128,038     CRYSTAL BLACK BAGUMBAYAN                   438,000.00 

22 2024 HYUNDAI - STARGAZER 1.5 GLS IV AT GAS CCF 2057 11,741       SILVER/BLACK BAGUMBAYAN                   741,000.00 

23 2024 ISUZU - D-MAX                 AT DSL BAG 8094 21,151       SPLASH WHITE BAGUMBAYAN                1,170,000.00 

24 2023 KIA - CARNIVAL                AT DSL DBH 3156 31,712       ASTRA BLUE BAGUMBAYAN                2,139,000.00 

25 2016 KIA - PICANTO                 AT GAS CBX 5836 74,454       CLEAR WHITE BAGUMBAYAN                   294,000.00 

26 2013 KIA - RIO                     AT GAS WIL917 168,123     BROWN BAGUMBAYAN                   229,000.00 

27 2023 MITSUBISHI - CANTER FE 71     MT DSL DBP 2531 35,593       NATURAL WHITE BAGUMBAYAN                1,415,000.00 

28 2016 MITSUBISHI - L300 DE LUXE 2.5 MT DSL NDY5704 96,315       POLAR WHITE BAGUMBAYAN                   309,000.00 

30 2025 MITSUBISHI - L300 FB          MT DSL NKK 6589 29,290       POLAR WHITE BAGUMBAYAN                   680,000.00 

31 2024 MITSUBISHI - MONTERO SPORT    AT DSL IAF 6192 22,693       JET BLACK MICA BAGUMBAYAN                1,324,000.00 

32 2025 MITSUBISHI - XPANDER          AT GAS NKC 5317 20,482       
GREEN BRONZE 

METALLIC
BAGUMBAYAN                   869,000.00 

33 2025 MITSUBISHI - XPANDER          AT GAS
GW 331A / NEZ 

3664
3,654         

SUNRISE ORANGE 

METALLIC WITH 2
BAGUMBAYAN                   969,000.00 

34 2015 MITSUBISHI MIRAGE G4 GLX      MT GAS NDR 7746 54,825       VIRGIL GRAY BAGUMBAYAN                   210,000.00 

35 2015 MITSUBISHI MIRAGE G4 GLX      MT GAS NDS5548 93,529       AURORA WHITE BAGUMBAYAN                   248,000.00 

36 2020 MITSUBISHI MIRAGE G4 GLX      AT GAS
DAT 3356 / B7 

Y554
37,325       WINE RED PEARL BAGUMBAYAN                   350,000.00 

37 2024 MITSUBISHI MIRAGE G4 GLX      AT GAS NKI 4414 19,153       
TITANIUM GRAY 

METALLIC
BAGUMBAYAN                   474,000.00 

BAGUMBAYAN (TAGUIG) WAREHOUSE

Manalac Avenue corner 1st Avenue, Bagumbayan, Taguig City

(Waze / Google Map: RCBC Auto Warehouse / Mang Inasal Commisary Taguig)

RCBC Cars For Sale - No Bid Required

EXTENDED until 4:00PM of November 21, 2025!

PASIG WAREHOUSE

8516 A. Sandoval Avenue, Brgy. Pinagbuhatan, Pasig City

(Waze / Google Map: RCBC Savings Bank Pasig Warehouse)

Reminders in submitting your Letter Of Intent via email to carsforsale@rcbc.com:

Acceptance Date: Until 4:00PM of November 21, 2025 only. No extension of deadline. 

Email Subject: “INTENT TO BUY (space) PLATE #” (e.g. INTENT TO BUY ABC1234)

Your email must contain the following details:
i. Plate No. / Conduction Sticker No. indicated in the price list 
ii.   Unit Description: Year Model , Brand/Variant, Price 
iii.  Buyer’s Name (Last Name, First Name, Middle Name)
iv.  Contact Information (email, mobile & landline nos.)
v.   Mode of Payment (Cash or Financing via RCBC Auto Loan)
vi.  Residential Address
vii. Confirmation that you have inspected the unit 
viii. Confirmation that you have verified the unit's status with LTO & HPG
ix. Confirmation that you have read and understood the list of requirements

for Cash & Auto Loan purchases

For inquiries, you may reach us thru the following
from Monday to Friday, 8:30AM to 5:30PM (exc. holidays):

Email:
carsforsale@rcbc.com

For new inquiries:
Jessica: 0998-868-1754 | Ge: 0918-990-3805

Clyde: 0968-259-0331 (VISMIN)

For follow-ups on purchased units:
Trunkline: (02) 8894-9000

Local Nos:
Gina: 7752 | Jen: 7753 | Keith: 7757 | Cams: 7709

Warehouse Schedule:
Monday to Sunday, 8:30AM to 5:00PM (exc. holidays)



No. Model Brand / Variant Transmission Plate # Mileage  Color  Warehouse Selling Price

38 2024 MITSUBISHI MIRAGE G4 GLX      AT GAS CCA 7218 54,244       C.SILVER.METAL BAGUMBAYAN                   475,000.00 

39 2024 MITSUBISHI MIRAGE G4 GLX      AT GAS NKJ 5437 10,295       
COOL SILVER 

METALLIC
BAGUMBAYAN                   571,000.00 

40 2024 MITSUBISHI MIRAGE G4 GLX      AT GAS NKJ 2219 9,076         
TITANIUM GRAY 

METALLIC
BAGUMBAYAN                   572,000.00 

41 2018 TOYOTA - FORTUNER 4X2 G SUV   AT DSL NEC 7104 156,735     BRONZE BAGUMBAYAN                   880,000.00 

43 2019 TOYOTA - HI-LUX 4X4           AT DSL DAN2015 -             
NEBULA BLUE 

METALLIC
BAGUMBAYAN                1,293,000.00 

44 2020 TOYOTA - RUSH 1.5 G A/T       AT GAS NEJ 6284 54,651       WHITE BAGUMBAYAN                   682,000.00 

45 2018 TOYOTA - VIOS                 MT GAS DAD 4620 285,177     BLACKISH RED MICA BAGUMBAYAN                   301,000.00 

46 2018 TOYOTA - VIOS                 AT GAS NEC 7362 113,853     GRAYISH BLUE M BAGUMBAYAN                   344,000.00 

47 2019 TOYOTA - VIOS                 AT GAS NBS 9400 116,262     
GRAYISH  BLUE MICA 

METALLIC
BAGUMBAYAN                   403,000.00 

48 2019 TOYOTA - VIOS                 AT GAS NBS 9399 111,482     
ALUMINA JADE 

METALLIC
BAGUMBAYAN                   403,000.00 

49 2019 TOYOTA - VIOS                 AT GAS NEA 1556 92,142       ALUMINA JADE M BAGUMBAYAN                   412,000.00 

50 2024 TOYOTA - VIOS                 AT GAS NKD 9971 16,645       
GRAYISH BLUE MICA 

METALLIC
BAGUMBAYAN                   573,000.00 

51 2017 CHEVROLET - TRAILBLAZER       AT DSL
NCP 8598 / 

WD5567
131,969     BLUE LAS PIÑAS                   575,000.00 

52 2021 FORD - RANGER                 AT DSL NGK 6902 58,944       ALUMINUM METALLIC LAS PIÑAS                   923,000.00 

53 2025 FORD - RANGER RAPTOR 2.0L BI 4 AT DSL NKK 5321 14,711       ARCTIC WHITE LAS PIÑAS                2,013,000.00 

56 2022 FOTON-TORNADO M4.2C VAN       MT DSL CBD 2561 32,514       WHITE LAS PIÑAS                   862,000.00 

58 2017 HONDA - CITY                  AT GAS DAB2515 82,179       RUBY RED LAS PIÑAS                   366,000.00 

59 2017 HONDA - CITY                  MT GAS
NAF9338 / 

DU6050
30,394       CRYSTAL BLACK LAS PIÑAS                   373,000.00 

60 2024 HONDA - CIVIC                 AT GAS NFS 2108 10,792       IGNITE RED METALLIC LAS PIÑAS                1,428,000.00 

61 2018 HONDA - CIVIC                 AT GAS DAM 6024 95,812       
COSMIC BLUE 

METALLIC
LAS PIÑAS                   628,000.00 

62 2018 HYUNDAI - ACCENT              MT GAS NCU 3482 64,352       RED LAS PIÑAS                   329,000.00 

63 2016 HYUNDAI - EON                 MT GAS
CCM 3036 / ACM 

3036
60,698       GOLD LAS PIÑAS                   166,000.00 

64 2015 HYUNDAI - H100                MT DSL ABR 5139 162,685     CREAMY WHITE LAS PIÑAS                   334,000.00 

65 2021 HYUNDAI - KONA                AT GAS CBB 3734 49,409       SILVER LAS PIÑAS                   562,000.00 

66 2023 ISUZU - NLR 85                MT DSL D3 Q986 3,456         ARC WHITE LAS PIÑAS                1,468,000.00 

67 2017 KIA - PICANTO                 AT GAS
NBB 8773 / EH 

0760
57,916       SIGNAL RED LAS PIÑAS                   260,000.00 

68 2022 MITSUBISHI - L300 FB          MT DSL NID 8026 68,196       POLAR WHITE LAS PIÑAS                   543,000.00 

69 2024 MITSUBISHI - L300 FB          MT DSL NFS 5099 21,572       POLAR WHITE LAS PIÑAS                   688,000.00 

70 2025 MITSUBISHI - MONTERO          MT DSL BAG 9714 12,518       JET BLACK MICA LAS PIÑAS                1,033,000.00 

71 2017 MITSUBISHI - STRADA           MT DSL EAA4269 170,675     PYRENESE BLACK LAS PIÑAS                   542,000.00 

74 2020 MITSUBISHI MIRAGE G4 GLX      MT GAS NGO 7661 136,077     SAVANNA WHITE LAS PIÑAS                   338,000.00 

75 2023 MITSUBISHI MIRAGE G4 GLX      AT GAS NEE8429 31,737       
COOL SILVER 

METALLIC
LAS PIÑAS                   473,000.00 

76 2025 MITSUBISHI MIRAGE G4 GLX      AT GAS DBS 6500 8,412         
COOL SILVER 

METALLIC
LAS PIÑAS                   524,000.00 

77 2024 MITSUBISHI MIRAGE G4 GLX      AT GAS NFS 4396 10,072       RED METALLIC LAS PIÑAS                   557,000.00 

78 2025 MITSUBISHI-XFORCE GLS 1.5G 2WD AT GAS
FS 308A / NKJ 

5812
6,101         

QUARTZ WHITE PEARL 

WITH BLACK 
LAS PIÑAS                1,076,000.00 

79 2017 NISSAN -  NAVARA              AT DSL NAT 3944 69,128       ASPEN WHITE LAS PIÑAS                   760,000.00 

80 2019 NISSAN - ALMERA               AT GAS CAU4789 48,753       
SAPPHIRE METALLIC 

BLUE
LAS PIÑAS                   333,000.00 

81 2020 NISSAN - ALMERA               AT GAS
NFZ 5525 / F3 

W419
42,749       

IRIDIUM METALLIC 

BROWN
LAS PIÑAS                   337,000.00 

82 2022 SUZUKI - DZIRE                AT GAS EAI 1221 85,532       RED LAS PIÑAS                   370,000.00 

83 2017 TOYOTA - FORTUNER             MT DSL VJ6157 188,732     GRAY METALLIC LAS PIÑAS                   772,000.00 

84 2018 TOYOTA - FORTUNER             AT DSL
NBT3632 / 

A6C489
63,652       

AVANT GARDE 

BRONZE METALLIC
LAS PIÑAS                   915,000.00 

85 2018 TOYOTA - FORTUNER             AT DSL A5T824 111,977     GRAY METTALIC LAS PIÑAS                   943,000.00 

87 2020 TOYOTA - HI-ACE               MT DSL
P7 B750 / NEF 

5529
315,569     SILVER METALLIC LAS PIÑAS                   669,000.00 

88 2020 TOYOTA - INNOVA               MT DSL DAO 9101 85,160       BLACKISH RED MICA LAS PIÑAS                   723,000.00 

89 2020 TOYOTA - RUSH                 AT GAS DAZ4272 88,994       
DARK RED MICA 

METALLIC
LAS PIÑAS                   659,000.00 

LAS PIÑAS WAREHOUSE

Grey gate w/ hexagon logo beside Colours Town Center, along Zapote Road, Las Piñas City

(Waze / Google Map : RCBC Las Pinas Warehouse)



No. Model Brand / Variant Transmission Plate # Mileage  Color  Warehouse Selling Price

90 2016 TOYOTA - VIOS                 AT GAS VG9292 / 130110 54,862       BLACKISH RED MICA LAS PIÑAS                   348,000.00 

91 2016 TOYOTA - VIOS                 AT GAS ABI 7680 81,307       RED MICA METALLIC LAS PIÑAS                   352,000.00 

92 2015 TOYOTA - WIGO                 AT GAS AEA 6753 134,827     SILVER METALLIC LAS PIÑAS                   269,000.00 

93 2019 TOYOTA - WIGO                 AT GAS
DAN1573(5253)/P

3N695
50,627       ORANGE METALLIC LAS PIÑAS                   348,000.00 

94 2019 FORD - EVEREST                AT DSL VAA 8924 90,180       ARCTIC WHITE SILANG                   827,000.00 

95 2024
GEELY - EMGRAND PREMIUM 

SEDAN 
AT GAS NHH 8404 14,864       DARK BLUE SILANG                   552,000.00 

96 2024 HONDA - BRV                   AT GAS NFM 5726 7,144         LUNAR SILVER M SILANG                   809,000.00 

97 2025 HONDA - BRV                   AT GAS
OU 957A / NKM 

2806
10,362       TAFFETA WHITE SILANG                   866,000.00 

99 2024 HYUNDAI - STARGAZER 1.5 GLS IV AT GAS CCF 1189 27,258       WHITE/BLACK SILANG                   747,000.00 

100 2018 ISUZU - MU-X 4X2 AT (LS-A)    AT DSL NAP 5987 196,641     SILKY PEARL WHITE SILANG                   800,000.00 

102 2024 ISUZU - TRAVIZ                MT DSL NKJ 8816 25,464       ARC WHITE SILANG                   929,000.00 

104 2022 MITSUBISHI - L300 FB          MT DSL CBK 4982 155,071     POLAR WHITE SILANG                   425,000.00 

105 2023 MITSUBISHI - L300 FB          MT DSL NIR 7486 31,181       POLAR WHITE SILANG                   625,000.00 

106 2024 MITSUBISHI - L300 FB          MT DSL NEY 3355 18,426       POLAR WHITE SILANG                   644,000.00 

107 2024 MITSUBISHI - L300 FB          MT DSL  NKE 7947 28,424       POLAR WHITE SILANG                   678,000.00 

108 2024 MITSUBISHI - L300 FB          MT DSL NFM 7833 21,154       POLAR WHITE SILANG                   678,000.00 

109 2024 MITSUBISHI - L300 FB          MT DSL NFS 4357 24,329       POLAR WHITE SILANG                   682,000.00 

110 2024 MITSUBISHI - L300 FB          MT DSL NKJ 4964 23,676       POLAR WHITE SILANG                   683,000.00 

111 2024 MITSUBISHI - L300 FB          MT DSL
GI 106A / NKI 

8460
60,435       POLAR WHITE SILANG                   693,000.00 

112 2024 MITSUBISHI - L300 FB          MT DSL NKK 9232 28,289       POLAR WHITE SILANG                   705,000.00 

113 2024 MITSUBISHI - L300 FB          MT DSL NKE 7951 13,980       POLAR WHITE SILANG                   706,000.00 

115 2019 MITSUBISHI - XPANDER          AT GAS EAD 9805 154,748     TITANIUM GRAY SILANG                   576,000.00 

116 2023 MITSUBISHI MIRAGE G4 GLS      AT GAS NFB 5826 20,231       RED METALLIC SILANG                   493,000.00 

117 2024 MITSUBISHI MIRAGE G4 GLS      AT GAS BAF 8859 13,672       RED METALLIC SILANG                   566,000.00 

118 2025 MITSUBISHI MIRAGE G4 GLS      AT GAS NHT 1430 6,915         
COOL SILVER 

METALLIC
SILANG                   667,000.00 

119 2020 MITSUBISHI MIRAGE G4 GLX      AT GAS CAV 5473 64,424       VIRGIL GRAY SILANG                   343,000.00 

120 2020 MITSUBISHI MIRAGE G4 GLX      AT GAS NGM 2500 52,043       WINE RED PEARL SILANG                   349,000.00 

121 2023 MITSUBISHI MIRAGE G4 GLX      AT GAS VAC 1163 79,734       RED METALLIC SILANG                   419,000.00 

122 2024 MITSUBISHI MIRAGE G4 GLX      AT GAS IAH 1592 34,708       RED METALLIC SILANG                   465,000.00 

123 2024 MITSUBISHI MIRAGE G4 GLX      AT GAS NFF 4462 41,099       TITANIUM GRAY SILANG                   474,000.00 

124 2023 MITSUBISHI MIRAGE G4 GLX      AT GAS NEE 5955 10,052       T.GRAY METALIC SILANG                   481,000.00 

125 2025 MITSUBISHI MIRAGE G4 GLX      AT GAS TK814A 11,441       RED METALLIC SILANG                   537,000.00 

126 2024 MITSUBISHI MIRAGE G4 GLX      AT GAS NKK 3936 11,449       RED METALLIC SILANG                   572,000.00 

127 2024 MITSUBISHI MIRAGE G4 GLX      AT GAS NKE 7841 8,618         
TITANIUM GRAY 

METALLIC
SILANG                   577,000.00 

128 2025 MITSUBISHI-XFORCE GLS 1.5G 2WD AT GAS
FS 740A / NKG 

7006
7,331         

ENERGETIC YELLOW 

METALLIC WITH
SILANG                1,098,000.00 

129 2025 MITSUBISHI-XPANDER CROSS 1.5 2 AT GAS DBO 6721 15,266       Q. WHITE PEARL SILANG                   944,000.00 

130 2020 MORRIS GARAGES - MG 5         AT GAS NFZ2006 112,429     CARBON GRAY SILANG                   359,000.00 

131 2024 MORRIS GARAGES - MG 5         AT GAS NJA 1050 8,415         RED SILANG                   403,000.00 

132 2025 NISSAN -  NAVARA              AT DSL
ND 491A / NHU 

6068
29,062       GALAXY BLACK SILANG                1,483,000.00 

133 2024 NISSAN - URVAN                MT DSL NKA 6392 26,549       ALPINE WHITE SILANG                1,041,000.00 

134 2025 SUZUKI - DZIRE                AT GAS EAJ 7607 55,032       
MAGMA GRAY 

METALLIC
SILANG                   506,000.00 

135 2024 SUZUKI - ERTIGA               AT GAS DNW 3612 37,998       DEEP RED SILANG                   777,000.00 

136 2024 SUZUKI - ERTIGA               AT GAS NNX 2062 32,251       PEARL SNOW WHITE SILANG                   790,000.00 

137 2025 SUZUKI - JIMNY                AT GAS EAH 3024 13,370       GRAY SILANG                1,466,000.00 

138 2024 SUZUKI - S-PRESSO             AT GAS DBN 3768 11,705       WHITE SILANG                   466,000.00 

Along Maguyam Road, Silang, Cavite

(Waze / Google Map: RCBC Warehouse Silang Cavite)

SILANG (CAVITE) WAREHOUSE



No. Model Brand / Variant Transmission Plate # Mileage  Color  Warehouse Selling Price

139 2023 SUZUKI - XL7                  AT GAS BAF 5299 56,479       WHITE SILANG                   743,000.00 

140 2019 TOYOTA - HI-LUX 4X4           MT DSL
P0 G674 / NEF 

4807
81,284       ATTITUDE BLACK MIKA SILANG                   786,000.00 

141 2019 TOYOTA - WIGO                 MT GAS NBH 2564 56,211       RED SILANG                   288,000.00 

142 2016 BAIC - MZ40 COMFORT           MT GAS LE 8480 84,666       WHITE CANDUMAN                   188,000.00 

143 2024 CHANGAN-CS15 1.5 DCT SUV      AT GAS GBF 5918 7,692         WHITE CANDUMAN                   594,000.00 

144 2019 HONDA - BRV                   AT GAS DAL 1787 68,239       MODERN STEEL CANDUMAN                   558,000.00 

145 2023 HYUNDAI - CRETA 1.5 GL IVT SUV AT GAS GBG 1842 35,136       WHITE CANDUMAN                   796,000.00 

146 2019 HYUNDAI - H100                MT DSL GAU 5737 68,673       CREAMY WHITE CANDUMAN                   481,000.00 

147 2022 MITSUBISHI - STRADA           AT DSL GAW 3958 39,586       
GRAPHITE GRAY 

METALLIC
CANDUMAN                   873,000.00 

148 2025 MITSUBISHI - XPANDER          AT GAS
GD 423A / GBI 

2778
10,698       

BLADE SILVER 

METALLIC
CANDUMAN                   832,000.00 

149 2024 MITSUBISHI-TRITON ATHLETE 4WD AT DSL GBF 3964 18,848       YAMABUKI ORANGE CANDUMAN                1,530,000.00 

150 2022 MORRIS GARAGES - ZS ALPHA     AT GAS GAS 9720 43,229       BLACK CANDUMAN                   521,000.00 

151 2024 NISSAN -  NAVARA              AT DSL GBC 3652 13,587       
FORGED METALLIC 

COPPER
CANDUMAN                1,028,000.00 

152 2024 NISSAN -  NAVARA              MT DSL HAG 8994 14,606       BRILLIANT SILVER CANDUMAN                1,069,000.00 

153 2024 NISSAN -  NAVARA              AT DSL HAH 2078 16,130       S.PEARL GRAY CANDUMAN                1,407,000.00 

155 2020 NISSAN - ALMERA               MT GAS HAC 8525 54,294       
IRIDIUM METALLIC 

BROWN
CANDUMAN                   265,000.00 

156 2024 NISSAN - ALMERA               AT GAS GBF 8223 1,988         CAYENNE RED CANDUMAN                   648,000.00 

157 2024 NISSAN - URVAN                MT DSL HAH 2881 9,188         GRANITE BLACK 2 CANDUMAN                1,285,000.00 

158 2025 SUZUKI - DZIRE                AT GAS
KP 839A / GBF 

9432
6,426         BLUE CANDUMAN                   676,000.00 

159 2024 TOYOTA - HI-ACE GL GRANDIA    AT DSL GBF 3632 19,092       
LUXURY PEARL 

TONING
CANDUMAN                1,909,000.00 

160 2025 TOYOTA - HI-ACE GL GRANDIA    AT DSL HAH 4456 21,621       
LUXURY PEARL 

TONING
CANDUMAN                2,103,000.00 

161 2016 TOYOTA - HI-LUX 4X4           AT GAS ACS1746 117,823     SILVER METTALIC CANDUMAN                   840,000.00 

162 2021 TOYOTA - VIOS                 AT GAS HAC 7340 129,572     RED MICA METALLIC CANDUMAN                   408,000.00 

163 2024 TOYOTA - VIOS                 AT GAS GBC 3443 62,865       SILVER METALLIC CANDUMAN                   487,000.00 

164 2023 TOYOTA - VIOS                 AT GAS GAP 1257 61,985       
ALUMINA JADE 

METALLIC
CANDUMAN                   521,000.00 

165 2024 FORD - RANGER                 AT DSL FAS 1788 20,630       ARCTIC WHITE BACOLOD                   987,000.00 

166 2024 GAC-GS3 EMZOOM GS SUV         AT GAS FAR 8939 21,009       SUPERSTAR SILVER BACOLOD                   749,000.00 

167 2015 HONDA - MOBILIO               AT GAS ABT 5738 78,740       CRYSTAL BLACK BACOLOD                   406,000.00 

168 2019 HYUNDAI - ACCENT              MT DSL FAH 5359 126,342     
CHALK WHITE WITH 

STICKER
BACOLOD                   285,000.00 

169 2024 HYUNDAI - STARGAZER 1.5 GLS IV AT GAS FAR 7754 23,774       BLACK BACOLOD                   806,000.00 

170 2022 MAXUS - T60                   AT GAS LAK 6562 47,585       RED BACOLOD                   716,000.00 

171 2022 MG - ZS T SUV                 AT GAS FAI 7749 47,097       RED BACOLOD                   441,000.00 

173 2024 SUZUKI - CARRY CAB AND CHA UTI MT GAS FAR 1693 17,939       WHITE BACOLOD                   519,000.00 

175 2024 SUZUKI - S-PRESSO             AT GAS FAR 7071 9,147         RED BACOLOD                   505,000.00 

176 2025
SUZUKI-S-PRESSO GL AGS 

HATCHBA
AT GAS GBJ 4714 9,839         WHITE BACOLOD                   550,000.00 

177 2022 CHANGAN - ALSVIN 1.5L 5DCT    AT GAS FAJ 2861 60,570       PEARL BLACK ILOILO-LEGANES                   340,000.00 

178 2022 FOTON - TRANSVAN 15 SEATER    MT DSL FAN 9756 39,314       WHITE ILOILO-LEGANES                   718,000.00 

179 2025 HONDA - CITY                  AT GAS FAS 7553 6,782         
METEOROID GRAY 

METALLIC
ILOILO-LEGANES                   940,000.00 

180 2024 ISUZU - D-MAX                 AT DSL FAR 6436 22,196       SPLASH WHITE ILOILO-LEGANES                1,188,000.00 

181 2020 KIA-K2500 2.5MT TSC2W C&C     MT DSL MAM 7034 93,429       WHITE ILOILO-LEGANES                   448,000.00 

182 2025 MITSUBISHI - XPANDER          AT GAS FAS 5523 8,168         RED METALLIC ILOILO-LEGANES                   912,000.00 

183 2023 MORRIS GARAGES - ZS ALPHA     AT GAS FAR 4619 10,655       RED ILOILO-LEGANES                   545,000.00 

ILOILO - LEGANES WAREHOUSE

Cor. Sta Barbara Airport Road, Brgy. San Vicente, Leganes, Iloilo City

(Waze / Google Map: St. Peter Chapels Iloilo. Ilolo-Leganes Warehouse is just across it.)

CANDUMAN (CEBU) WAREHOUSE

VSEF Warehouse Canduman, Sitio Apas Riverside Canduman, Mandaue City, Cebu

(Waze / Google Map: DJ Nino Hardware & Junkshop Hardware Store. Cebu-Canduman Warehouse is just across it.)

BACOLOD WAREHOUSE

Dana Land, #22, Lacson St., Capitol Subsivision, Bacolod City

(Waze / Google Map: RCBC Auto Bacolod Warehouse)



No. Model Brand / Variant Transmission Plate # Mileage  Color  Warehouse Selling Price

184 2023 MORRIS GARAGES - ZS STYLE     MT GAS AA 686A 8,633         ORANGE ILOILO-LEGANES                   453,000.00 

185 2024 SUZUKI - DZIRE                MT GAS FAR 3414 46,724       
MAGMA GRAY 

METALLIC
ILOILO-LEGANES                   411,000.00 

186 2024 SUZUKI - S-PRESSO             MT GAS FAQ 9338 1,672         RED ILOILO-LEGANES                   462,000.00 

187 2023 TOYOTA - RAIZE 1.0 TURBO SUV  AT GAS FAN 9842 35,478       
TURQUOISE MICA 

METALLIC/BLACK
ILOILO-LEGANES                   766,000.00 

188 2023 FORD - RANGER                 AT DSL ZAC 7839 66,490       METEOR GRAY OPOL                   773,000.00 

189 2024 GAC-M6PRO 1.5TGDI7WDCT AT GAS ZAD5272 13,385       ELEGANT BLACK OPOL                1,114,000.00 

190 2019 HYUNDAI - ACCENT              AT GAS ZAA 8873 55,291       SILVER OPOL                   368,000.00 

191 2021 ISUZU - D-MAX                 AT DSL KAG 7118 96,726       SPLASH WHITE OPOL                   929,000.00 

192 2023 KIA - SOLUTO                  MT GAS ZAC 9614 45,178       BEIGE OPOL                   409,000.00 

193 2024 KIA - SOLUTO                  AT GAS ZAC 9610 33,248       RED OPOL                   525,000.00 

195 2024 MITSUBISHI - XPANDER          AT GAS KAR 9393 45,703       RED METALLIC OPOL                   800,000.00 

196 2025 MITSUBISHI - XPANDER          AT GAS KBB 8301 10,952       
GREEN BRONZE 

METALLIC
OPOL                   921,000.00 

197 2024 MITSUBISHI MIRAGE G4 GLX      AT GAS KBB 7306 10,972       GRAY OPOL                   509,000.00 

199 2024 NISSAN -  NAVARA              AT DSL JAJ 8057 20,335       GALAXY BLACK OPOL                1,259,000.00 

200 2023 NISSAN -  NAVARA              AT DSL JAO 2576 45,050       S PEARL GRAY OPOL                1,315,000.00 

201 2017 SUZUKI - CIAZ GL- MT          MT GAS
HAA 2512 / UE 

7120
163,270     GRAY OPOL                   330,000.00 

202 2025 SUZUKI - DZIRE                AT GAS ZAD 4747 10,066       GRAY OPOL                   579,000.00 

203 2020 SUZUKI - SWIFT                MT GAS ZAB 7487 45,007       WHITE OPOL                   381,000.00 

204 2023 TOYOTA - VIOS                 AT GAS ZAF 1701 24,623       BLACK 1 OPOL                   591,000.00 

205 2021 MITSUBISHI - STRADA           MT DSL LAI 1325 86,691       
GRAPHITE GRAY 

METALLIC
GENSAN                   797,000.00 

207 2018 FORD - RANGER                 MT DSL KAB3270 278,604     COOL WHITE DAVAO                   586,000.00 

208 2022 FOTON-TORNADO M4.2C VAN       MT DSL CBD 4188 30,041       WHITE DAVAO                   914,000.00 

209 2017 MAZDA - 2 SERIES              AT GAS GAB 1528 106,935     TITANIUM FLASH DAVAO                   326,000.00 

210 2025 MITSUBISHI - L300 FB          MT DSL LAP 7953 19,072       POLAR WHITE DAVAO                   703,000.00 

211 2022 MITSUBISHI - MIRAGE           AT GAS LAJ 5066 63,234       RED METALLIC DAVAO                   356,000.00 

212 2023 MITSUBISHI - MONTERO          AT DSL LAM 8281 31,773       
STERLING SILVER 

METALLIC
DAVAO                1,263,000.00 

213 2015 MITSUBISHI - STRADA           MT DSL ABC 5184 150,319     PYRENESE BLACK DAVAO                   607,000.00 

214 2023 MITSUBISHI - STRADA           MT DSL LAL 8440 153,199     WHITE DIAMOND DAVAO                   954,000.00 

216 2024 MITSUBISHI-TRITON GLX 2WD AT M AT DSL LAP 7291 25,056       WHITE DIAMOND DAVAO                1,103,000.00 

217 2024 NISSAN -  NAVARA              AT GAS LAO 2828 16,807       BRILLIANT SILVER DAVAO                1,022,000.00 

218 2020 NISSAN -  NAVARA              MT DSL LAI 3325 147,990     GALAXY BLACK DAVAO                   553,000.00 

219 2024 NISSAN -  NAVARA              MT DSL LAN 9851 34,519       BRILLIANT SILVER DAVAO                   967,000.00 

221 2022 SUZUKI - DZIRE                AT GAS LAL 2806 22,350       
METALLIC MAGMA 

GRAY
DAVAO                   434,000.00 

222 2025 SUZUKI - DZIRE                AT GAS LAO 4898 11,996       BLUE DAVAO                   544,000.00 

223 2025 SUZUKI - DZIRE                AT GAS MBD 8293 22,471       RED DAVAO                   552,000.00 

224 2025 SUZUKI - DZIRE                AT GAS MBD 7481 27,621       BLUE DAVAO                   576,000.00 

225 2021 SUZUKI - S-PRESSO             MT GAS MAT 7076 114,845     ORANGE DAVAO                   326,000.00 

226 2025
SUZUKI-S-PRESSO GL AGS 

HATCHBA
AT GAS

LAO 9914 / 

RZ873A
5,471         RED DAVAO                   555,000.00 

Purok Kawa, Brgy. Dadiangas West, General Santos City

(Waze / Google Map: Dadiangas West Central Elementary School. GenSan Warehouse is near the area.)

DAVAO WAREHOUSE

Sitio Filomena, Catalunan Grande, Davao City

(Waze / Google Map: EZA Residencia. Davao Warehouse is near the area.)

Note: Units with asterisk (*) - with special concerns that are known by the Bank

All units are sold on an AS-IS-WHERE-IS basis. Units' availability and prices are subject to change without prior notice. The Bank reserves the right to withdraw any unit without any prior notice. 

Inadvertent misprints shall not alter the unit's factual condition nor shall they be deemed as misinterpretation of the unit.

OPOL (CAGAYAN DE ORO) WAREHOUSE

PJL Warehouse, Bonbon Opol, Misamis Oriental

(Waze / Google Map: PJL Warehouse, GH87+VJG, Opol, Misamis Oriental; Landmark: Near GLTMI Love & Truth Opol Church)

GENSAN WAREHOUSE



All RCBC Auto Warehouses are open 

daily from 8:30AM to 5:00PM 

(except holidays)

Walk-in clients are welcome.

No need to set an appointment



Pasig Warehouse:
8516 A. Sandoval Avenue, Brgy.
Pinagbuhatan, Pasig City
(Waze / Google Map: RCBC Auto Pasig
Warehouse)

Las Pinas Warehouse:
Black gate beside Colours Town Center, 
along Zapote Road, Las Pinas City 
(Waze / Google Map : RCBC Las Pinas 
Warehouse)

LUZON/METRO MANILA WAREHOUSE

Bagumbayan Warehouse:
Manalac Avenue corner 1st Avenue,
Bagumbayan, Taguig City
(Waze / Google Map: RCBC Auto 
Warehouse

Silang Warehouse:
Along Maguyam Road, Silang Cavite 
(Waze / Google Map : RCBC Warehouse 
Silang Cavite)



VISAYAS WAREHOUSE

Bacolod Warehouse:
Dana Land, #22, 13th Lacson St. Capitol Subsivision Bacolod City 
Waze / Google Map: RCBC Auto Bacolod Warehouse

Canduman Warehouse:
VSEF Warehouse Canduman, Sitio Apas Riverside Canduman, Mandaue City, Cebu
Waze / Google Map: RCBC Auto Canduman Warehouse

Iloilo Warehouse:
Corner Sta. Barbara Airport Road, Brgy San Vicente Leganes Iloilo City
Search for St. Peter Chapels Iloilo on Waze or Google Maps. The warehouse is
across St. Peter Chapels



MINDANAO WAREHOUSE

Opol Warehouse (New Location):
PJL Warehouse, Bonbon Opol, Misamis Oriental
Waze / Google Map: PJL Warehouse, GH87+VJG, Opol, Mis. Or. 

GenSan Warehouse:
Purok Kawa, Barangay Dadiangas West, General Santos city
Search for Dadiangas West Central Elementary School on Waze or Google Maps.
The warehouse is near the area

CATALUNAN GRANDE WAREHOUSE:
Sitio Filomena Catalunan Grande Davao city
Search for EZA Residencia on Waze or Google Maps. The warehouse is near the area



REQUIREMENTS 
(Applicable for CASH purchases) 

 
FOR INDIVIDUALS 
 
Documentary Requirements: 

LOCALLY EMPLOYED SELF-EMPLOYED 

 Auto Reservation Form  
(applicable for No Bid Required only) 

 Auto Reservation Form  
(applicable for No Bid Required only) 

 Bid Form  
(applicable for Sealed Bidding only) 

 Bid Form  
(applicable for Sealed Bidding only) 

 Customer Relationship Form (Bank Form)  Customer Relationship Form (Bank Form) 

 2 Valid Government-Issued IDs  2 Valid Government-Issued IDs 

 TIN ID / TIN Verification Slip  TIN ID / TIN Verification Slip 

 Latest Proof of Billing  Latest Proof of Billing 

 Latest BIR 2316   DTI Business Registration 

OR  Latest Income Tax Return 

Certificate of Employment  
(w/ Compensation & Tenure) 

 Audited Financial Statement 

 
Note: Other documents may be required upon evaluation.  
 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------- 
 
FOR CORPORATIONS 
 
Documentary Requirements: 

 Auto Reservation Form (applicable for No Bid Required only) 

 Bid Form (applicable for Sealed Bidding only) 

 Customer Relationship Form (for the Corporation & its authorized signatory/ies; Bank Form) 

 2 Valid Government-Issued IDs of Authorized Signatory/ies 

 TIN ID of Authorized Signatory/ies 

 BIR Form 2303 (BIR Certificate of Registration) 

 Latest Community Tax Certificate (CEDULA) 

 SEC Certificate of Registration 

 SEC Articles of Incorporation & By-Laws 

 Latest SEC General Information Sheet (GIS) 

 Latest BIR Form 1702 (Income Tax Return) 

 Audited Financial Statement 

 Notarized Secretary’s Certificate (Authorizing the purchase and designation of its authorized 
signatory/ies) 

 
Note: Other documents may be required upon evaluation. 



 

REQUIREMENTS 
(Applicable for purchases via Auto Loan) 

 
 
FOR INDIVIDUALS 
 
 
Eligibility: 

LOCALLY EMPLOYED SELF-EMPLOYED 

 Filipino or Dual Citizen  Filipino or Dual Citizen 

 At least 21 years old upon loan 
application 

 At least 21 years old upon loan application 

 At most 70 years old upon loan maturity  At most 70 years old upon loan maturity 

 Must have a mobile number and a 
residence or office landline 

 Must have a mobile number and a 
residence or office landline 

 With a minimum employment tenure of 1 
year and minimum gross monthly income 
of Php40,000.00 

 Business must be in profitable operations 
for the past 2 years 

 
 
Documentary Requirements: 

LOCALLY EMPLOYED SELF-EMPLOYED 

 Auto Loan Application Form (Bank Form)  Auto Loan Application Form (Bank Form) 

 Auto Reservation Form  
(applicable for No Bid Required only) 

 Auto Reservation Form  
(applicable for No Bid Required only) 

 Bid Form  
(applicable for Sealed Bidding only) 

 Bid Form  
(applicable for Sealed Bidding only) 

 Customer Relationship Form (Bank Form)  Customer Relationship Form (Bank Form) 

 2 Valid Government-Issued IDs  2 Valid Government-Issued IDs 

 TIN ID / TIN Verification Slip  TIN ID / TIN Verification Slip 

 Latest Proof of Billing (Utility Bill)  Latest Proof of Billing (Utility Bill) 

 Latest BIR 2316   DTI Business Registration 

OR  Audited Financial Statement 

Certificate of Employment  
(w/ Compensation & Tenure) 

 Latest Income Tax Return or Bank 
Statements 

 
Note: Other documents may be required upon evaluation.  
 


